Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Hi Chiang,
COR I/s $750, 2 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 4 May 2023 12:06 PM

Yeo Poh Suan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)
Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

RE: SHB5246U

SHB5246U(TAX01.23.2045)final.pdf; 5246 marking .pdf

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <PohSuan.Yeo@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, March 1, 2023 11:48 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SHB5246U

Hi Taufikh,

Attached herewith the repair estimate of SHB5246U having Case No: TAX/01/23/2045.
There is no change to the approved amount of $750 @ 2 working days under lump sum repair.

Cost of Repair invoice will be generated as approved.

Please finalize with me within 7 working days, thanks.

Thanks & Regards
Yeo Poh Suan
Strides Automotive Services

PohSuan.Yeo@strides.com.sg

STRIDES

AUTOMOTIVE




