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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Helmut Widdek <helmutwiddek@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 20 February 2023 5:07 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFQ1282K(AIG) AND GBH4729P AT/ ALONG ORCHARD 

ROAD (NEAR FAR EAST PLAZA) ON 05/01/2023

Dear Mr. Hsiao Tong, 
 
I acknowledge your letter as a representative of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. 'Audi Auto Protector Policy’. 
 
The incident happened during a heavy thunderstorm and the traffic slowed down to a stop and go situation. The 
change of lane was clearly signalled. 
The driver Mr. Hon Yong Seng was speeding in the right lane hit my car and was only able to stop approximate 8 
Meter after hitting my car. 
Under the above condition the behaviour of the driver should be seen as reckless. 
 
During the exchange of information we were able to take photos of our car and the other vehicle with the plate No. 
GBH4729P. 
My car was damaged on the driver side just at the height of the right front wheel. 
 
The delivery van showed no damage and it is documented by photos taken at the scene on January 5 2023 at 2.54 
pm. 
 
regards 
Helmut Widdek 
 
P.s. The relevant photos will be sent by a separate email. 
 
 
 
 
 

On 18-02-2023, at 12:38, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
 
WIDDEK HELMUT                                [By Email Only] 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
Our Ref: CC6/AIG23000718/Apa3 
You Ref: SFQ1282K 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFQ1282K(AIG) AND GBH4729P AT/ ALONG ORCHARD ROAD (NEAR FAR 
EAST PLAZA) ON 05/01/2023 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are 
the loss adjuster appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with 
the third-party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received third party claim from GBH4729P against your insurance policy. 
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Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your 
favour. Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim 
at best to avoid further litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, 
please contact us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to 
this Third-Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized 
for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
  
Thank you. 
  
 
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: - 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


