Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd
Letter of Demand

Our Ref: SKU 3741 J
18-Jan-2023

China Taiping Insurance(S) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Dear Sir/Mdm:
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU3741J AND SJK5316E ON 31-DEC-2022 AT ALONG PAN
ISLAND EXPRESSWAY

We are acting on behalf of the owner/driver to recover his vehicle damages and losses
sustainer in the above accident from the third party driver/ or insurers.

Description Amount

Repair Costs $ 14,904.00
Loss of Rental $120.00 X 14 days $ 1,680.00
Loss Of Use $0.00 X 0 days $ -
Search Fees (LTA) $ 26.75
Surveyor fees $ -
Others Claim $ -

Amount $ 16,610.75

Please look into our client claims and let us hear from you shortly.

Thank you

Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd
Tel : 8399 6267
email : xinhuaworkshop@gmail.com
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WORKSHOP PTE LTD

Profoma Invoice

ADDRESS

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte

Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4

#04-01 (South Wing)

Singapore 415933
xinhuaworkshop@gmail.com

GST Registration No. : 201838521G

PROFOMA INVOICE 387

NO.

Ltd DATE 18/01/2023
3 Anson Road #16-00
Springleaf Tower
079909
DATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
SKU 3741 J - Mitsubishi Lancer 13,800.00
Date of Accident: 31/12/2022
Lump Sum Repair for Third Party Claim
SUBTOTAL 13,800.00
GST TOTAL 1,104.00
e $$14,904.00
Accepted By Accepted Date



Auto Star Automotive Pte Ltd

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4

# 04-01

Singapore 415933
autostar.automotive@yahoo.com
Company Registration No. 2020290082

ADDRESS

Tan Siong Chiow

112 Aljunied Crescent,
#12-132,

Singapore 380112.

SLV 4698 C - Honda Vezel

Rental Period: 3/1/2023 - 16/1/2023
$120 x 14 days

(Replacement Vehicle: SKU 3741 J)

Cheque should be crossed and made to Auto Star Automotive
Pte Ltd or E-transfer A/C: 601-304835-001 OCBC Bank.

Accepted By

We appreciate your business and look forward to serve you again soon.

Accepted Date
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Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2
Print Date/Time : 03 Jan 2023 / 14:02:34
Receipt Date/Time : 03 Jan 2023 / 14:02:33

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-230103-002158
Previous Receipt No. :

SIN Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S$) (S$) (S%)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SUK5316E

As at 31 Dec 2022/21:35:00

Insurance Co: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SIK5316E

Enquiry Fee 24.77 1.98 26.75
20230103140132537162
Sub-Total 24.77 1.98 26.75
Total Before Rounding 24.77 1.98 26.75
Rounding Difference 0.00
Total Amount Payable 26.75
Paid By
421808XXXXXX8786 eNETS Credit Card 26.75
Total 26.75
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 26.75
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee
may apply.



EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 6 February 2023 3:15 pm

To: linfeng2488 @hotmail.com

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJK5316E (CHINA TAIPING) AND SKU3741J) AT/ALONG

JUNCTION WOODSVILLE FLYOVER PIE TO AMK CTE ON 31/12/2022

Our Ref: CC6/CTI23000715/Apa3

Insured Name : Lin Feng
Insured Driver : Lin Feng

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJK5316E (CHINA TAIPING) AND SKU3741) AT/ALONG JUNCTION WOODSVILLE FLYOVER PIE TO
AMK CTE ON 31/12/2022

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SKU3741J against your motor insurance policy.
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. Therefore, we
shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further litigation, which

would escalate to even more cost.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 07 days from the date of this letter.

Thank you.

*I am working from home from 30~17th February 2023. If you wish to contact me, pls whatsapp call at 80287880 or email.

Best Regards,
Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@Ilkkauto.com |
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)



EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 16 June 2023 12:41 PM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Alfred Toh; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Pauline
Tham

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJK5316E (Ol:

SNM23D200027/C02/SJK5316E/TANKL) AND SKU3741J (TP : LKK REF -
CCo6/CTI23000715/Apa3) on 31/12/2022

LKK REF: CC6/CTI23000715/Apa3

CTI REF: SNM23D200027/C02/SJK5316E/TANKL/TOHHS
Dear Ezlyna

We thank you for your email of even date.

Please let us have us have your findings on the property damage claim and close your file and let us have your bill for
services rendered while we await for the amended Letter of Demand for the combined claim.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Assistant Manager
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: XEHfiE TaipingSG
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and
any copies of it thereafter.

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, June 16, 2023 12:14 PM

To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>; Bryan Ang
(LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ilkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJK5316E (Ol: SNM23D200027/C02/SJK5316E/TANKL) AND SKU3741)
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI23000715/Apa3) on 31/12/2022

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Alfred,



We refer to your email below.

We was told by third party workshop — Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd that their client wanted to consolidate both PD & PI
claims. Thank you.

With warmest regards,
Ezlyna

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2023 3:23 PM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Pauline Tham
<pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIK5316E (Ol: SNM23D200027/C02/SJK5316E/TANKL) AND SKU3741)
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI123000715/Apa3) on 31/12/2022

LKK REF: CC6/CTI23000715/Apa3
CTI REF: SNM23D200027/C02/SJK5316E/TANKL/TOHHS

Dear Ezlyna
We thank you for your email pertaining to the above matter.

Please advise the reason for M/S XIN HUA WORKSHOP PTE LTD to pass to solicitors when the claim is handled by your
good office in the first instance.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Assistant Manager
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: XE¥ifif TaipingSG
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and
any copies of it thereafter.

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2023 2:44 PM

To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIK5316E (Ol: SNM23D200027/C02/SJK5316E/TANKL) AND SKU3741)
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI123000715/Apa3) on 31/12/2022




CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Alfred,

We refer to our earlier tele conversation.

Please be informed that third party workshop — Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd has passed this PD claim to solicitor.
Thank you.

With warmest regards,
Ezlyna
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 13, 2023 9:38 AM

To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; EzLyna (LKKAuto)
<ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIK5316E (Ol: SNM23D200027/C02/SJK5316E/TANKL) AND SKU3741)
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI123000715/Apa3) on 31/12/2022

Dear Sirs,
We are preparing report to seek mandate from your good office.
Hi Lyna,

Please follow up. Thanks.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 10:15 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong
3




(LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJIK5316E (Ol: SNM23D200027/C02/SJK5316E/TANKL) AND SKU3741)
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI123000715/Apa3) on 31/12/2022

LKK REF - CC6/CTI123000715/Apa3
CIT REF - SNM23D200027/C02/SJK5316E/TANKL/TOHHS

Dear Sirs

| have taken over conduct of the claim from Kah Leong.

Please assist to check and advise on update of the property damage claim at your earliest convenience.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Assistant Manager
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A ]l TaipingSG
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and
any copies of it thereafter.

From: Tan Kah Leong

Sent: Wednesday, January 25, 2023 5:14 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM23D200027/C02/SJK5316E/TANKL / RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJK5316E (Ol : CTI -
SNM23D200027/C02/TANKL) AND SKU3741J (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI23000715/Apa3) on 31/12/2022

Without Prejudice

Dear Mei Kwan,

We refer to your email below.

Attached is our insured’s accident report for your necessary actions.
Please seek our mandate approval before any claims settlement.
Thank you.

Note: Password will be sent in separate email.

NOTICE :



In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via
email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6193 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 January 2023 8:57 am

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: O/R: SNM23D200027/C02/SIK5316E/TANKL / RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJK5316E (Ol : CTI -
TBA) AND SKU3741)J (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI123000715/Apa3) on 31/12/2022

Dear all,

Please note that officer in charge for this case is Tan Kah Leong.

Claim no SNM23D200027/C02/SJK5316E/TANKL.

Dear Kah Leong,

Pls revert LKK.



Thank you

Chong Boon Sen

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: AWl Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and
any copies of it thereafter.
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