Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 April 2023 11:52 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SKM156K FINALIZE

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 April 2023 11:52:24 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: steven.chee@tridenteautomobili.com.sg <steven.chee@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>

Cc: jasmine.ng@tridenteautomobili.com.sg <jasmine.ng@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>; danny.goh@tridenteautomobili.com.sg <danny.goh@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>;
chinglik.wong@tridenteautomobili.com.sg <chinglik.wong@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKM156K FINALIZE

Dear Steve,
Without prejudice
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $7,550.70 and GST with 2 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly send the relevant documents to China Taiping Insurance company.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 11:03 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SKM156K FINALIZE

From: Steven Chee <steven.chee@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 April 2023 11:02:46 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Jasmine Ng Li Lee <jasmine.ng@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>; Danny Goh <danny.goh@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>; Wong Ching Lik
<chinglik.wong@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SKM156K FINALIZE

Dear Taufikh,
Please kindly revert on finalize
Thank you

Best regards,

TlHanemali

Steven Chee

Service Advisor

Tridente Automobili Pte Ltd

30 Leng Kee Road, Unit 01-02, Singapore 159100

T(+65) 6475 2168 F(+65) 6472 2928 HP (+65) 8693 3065
Email: steven.chee@tridenteautomobili.com.sg

From: Steven Chee

Sent: Wednesday, March 15, 2023 5:33 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com

Cc: Jasmine Ng Li Lee <jasmine.ng@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>; Danny Goh <danny.goh@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>; Wong Ching Lik
<chinglik.wong@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SKM156K FINALIZE

Hi,
Please kindly revert

Best regards,

W/

Steven Chee

Service Advisor

Tridente Automobili Pte Ltd

30 Leng Kee Road, Unit 01-02, Singapore 159100



T(+65) 6475 2168 F(+65) 6472 2928 HP (+65) 8693 3065
Email: steven.chee@tridenteautomobili.com.sg

From: Steven Chee

Sent: Thursday, March 2, 2023 5:59 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com

Cc: Jasmine Ng Li Lee <jasmine.ng@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>; Danny Goh <danny.goh@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>; Wong Ching Lik
<chinglik.wong@tridenteautomobili.com.sg>

Subject: SKM156K FINALIZE

Dear claims,

Please refer to the attached finalize & photo
COR : $7,550.70

DOR : 2 working days.

Please kindly revert.

Thank you

Best regards,

Y

Steven Chee

Service Advisor

Tridente Automobili Pte Ltd

30 Leng Kee Road, Unit 01-02, Singapore 159100

T(+65) 6475 2168 F(+65) 6472 2928 HP (+65) 8693 3065
Email: steven.chee@tridenteautomobili.com.sg




