Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, January 17, 2023 5:22 PM

To: Cecilia Lee

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: CHECK MV - SJB8393J - SNM22D209102/C0O1/LEEPG - DOA 16/12/2022 23:05
Dear Cecilia,

The MV of SJB 8393 is $82,000 - $84,000 (Est) as at Dec 2022.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Xin Yu | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315 | email: xinyu@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, January 16, 2023 3:29 PM

To: assighments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: CHECK MV - SJIB8393J - SNM22D209102/C01/LEEPG - DOA 16/12/2022 23:05
Hi LKK

Please see attached.

Kindly let us have your advice on MV as at DOA 16/12/2022 23:05



Transfer Of Vehicle Ownership (Ack nowledgement)

Vehicle Details
Vehicle Mo.:

Vehicle Type:

Vehicle Make:

Chassis No.:

Motor No.:

Propellant:

Engine Capacity:

Unladen Weight:

Primary Colour:

IU Label No.:

First Registration Date:
Manufacturing Year:
PARF Eligibility:

No. of Transfer:

Next Owner Particulars
Next Owner Name:

Next Qwner ID Type:
Next Owner 1D:
Registerad Address Type:
Registered Block/House No.:
Registered Street Name:
Registered Unit No.:
Registered Building Mame:
Registered Postal Code:
COE No./Expiry Date:
COE Bid Category:

QP Paid:

Transaction Details

5JB8393)
P11 - Passenger Station Wagon/Jeep/Land Vel Sefini
Rover
TOYOTA Vehicle Model:
JTJBARBZ102027520 Engine No.:

Trailer Chassis No.:
Petrol Passenger Capacity:
1998 e Power Rating:
1755kg Maximum Laden Weight:
Silver Secondary Colour-
1125913699 Maximum Power Qutput:
13Aug 2015 Original Registration Date:
2015 Cnan Market \ahio:
Yes Minimum PARF Benefit:
0 Actual ARF Paid:

PHUAYI HUI JASMINE
Singapore NRIC

HDB/HUDC

PETIRROAD

]

2015090102000932W / 12 A ug 2025
B-Car above 1600cc or 97kW [130bhp)
$60,789.00

Business Transaction Ref. No..201905 17161026701867

Business Transaction Date:
Business Transaction Time:

Message

You have successfully initiated the transfer of your vehicle. The next owner has to confir

The notification delivery date will be sy biect to validation of address withsource agency

17 May 2019
16:10:26

0K Save asPDF

Normal

LEXUS NX200T EXECUTIVE
BARW103856

2350 kg

175.0kW (234 bhg)
13 Aug 2015

441 84400
$25,376.00
$50,753.00

m the transfer by 22 May 2019,



Transfer Of Vehicle Ownership (Confirmation)

Vehicle Details
Viehicle Ma: SJBB3R3)
Vehicls Type: P11- Passenger Station Wagon/ Jeep/Land

Vehicle Attachment 1

Rover
Mo Attachment

Wehicle Scheme: Normal

Vefrcle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Medel: LEXUS M 300T EXECUTIVE
Chassis Na,: JTIBARBZ 102037520
Ergine Mo.: BARW 103856

Engine Capacity: 1998 o

Maximum Fower Cutput: — 175.0kW [234 bhg)
Actua ARF Paid; $50,753.00

Lifespan Expiry Date:

Road Tax Expiry Chate: 12 Aug 2019
Temporary Start Date; 22 apr 2019
Temnparary End Date 21 Jul 2019

Transfer Count: a

Transfar Date: 17 Mey 2019

Used Vehicle Dealer Particulars

Dealer 1D Type Connpany
Dealer 1D: H01119219M
Crealer Mame: FRIVILEGE MOTORS FTE LTD.

Mext Owner Particulars
Mext Cramer ID Type:

Singapose MRIC

Mant Chamer 10

Salutation: Piss

Mext Cwvner Name FHUA YT HUI JASMINE
Cender. Female

Birth Crate: e
Mext COwner Address

Fegistered Addeess Type HOE S HUDC

Rapistered Block/House Mo, -

Registered Street Name:
Registered Unit No.-
Registered Building Mame
Registered Postal Code:
Mext Owner Contacts
Hame Telephone Mo
Handphone Mo.:

Office Telephane MNe,

PETIR ROAD

Fax Mo
Email Address:
Amaount Payable By Mext Owner Upon Confirmation
Amount Before GST G5T Amount Amount After GST
(5% 15%5] (3 3]
Transfer Fee: 25,00
Total Amount Payable: i
25.00

Thanks & Best Regards,

Cecilia Lee

Senior Executive

Claims Department

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the

e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.



