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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 1 March 2023 12:07 PM
To: yonghuidesign@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Accident involving our vehicle NO.SLH6954Z on 19 JAN 20223 Along 

woodlands ave 3 twds woodlands ctr *** LKK REF: CC3/CTI23000658/Tpa3

Dear Sirs, 
 
We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. Therefore, we shall proceed 
to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further litigation, which would 
escalate to even more cost. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 10:33 AM 
To: yonghuidesign@gmail.com 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving our vehicle NO.SLH6954Z on 19 JAN 20223 Along woodlands ave 3 twds woodlands 
ctr *** LKK REF: CC3/CTI23000658/Tpa3 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
The 3rd party veh no - SHB 261H. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Yong Hui <yonghuidesign@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 15 February 2023 3:51 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident involving our vehicle NO.SLH6954Z on 19 JAN 20223 Along woodlands ave 3 twds woodlands 
ctr *** LKK REF: CC3/CTI23000658/Tpa3 
 

Hi Mei Kwan, attached below are the video footages of the accident. Do let me know if you need more of the before 
and after footage. 
https://www.dropbox.com/sh/olk57bkgqcr6knv/AAAl8OU1RyxYRhM607QnYFLja?dl=0 

 

On Mon, Feb 13, 2023 at 12:11 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

  

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

Kindly assist. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Yong Hui <yonghuidesign@gmail.com>  
Sent: Sunday, 12 February 2023 5:59 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Accident involving our vehicle NO.SLH6954Z on 19 JAN 20223 Along woodlands ave 3 twds woodlands ctr 

  

Hi Miss Hsiao Tong, 
 
I have received a letter regarding this claim against my vehicle. I am not sure what is happening as the vehicle that 
is filing claims against my vehicle is my own car plate number. Please advice. I do not need to file any claims unless 
the other party try to file for claim. The situation is that the taxi driver hit and run my vehicle but i wasnt able to get 
his car plate number. If anything I am filing against him but unfortunately i do not know his car plate number. Also I 
have made a police report on the day but the insurance one as i am not aware that i need to contact the insurance 
company  

  

 Please advise. 
 

  

--  

Best regards, 
Yong Hui (CGlas) 
 
DeviantArt 
Tumblr 
Patreon 
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UC9-46TdlvoQM1XK9Ex7FsxQ 

 
 
 
--  
Best regards, 
Yong Hui (CGlas) 
 
DeviantArt 
Tumblr 
Patreon 
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UC9-46TdlvoQM1XK9Ex7FsxQ 


