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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 18 January 2023 11:27 AM
To: admin-d; assignments; SUR
Cc: Ng Chen How; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim
Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C20019406 /CH || OI-FBK1771U  (BLACK) TP-GBB9044E  || 

Est: $4,539.05 || SPARK CAR CARE PTE LTD
Attachments: C20019406 - GBB9044E.zip

Hi Team,  
 

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: GBB9044E 

Please kindly take note that the officer in-charge is Mr.Chen How , who is copied in the email.  
We appreciate if you can keep him in the loop. 
 

Spark Car Care Pte Ltd 
205 Braddell Road Singapore 579701 
 
T :  63837419 / 97213705 Johari BH 

Please find attached GIA reports for your reference. 
 
Thank you. 
Best regards, 
 
Maybie Chua 
Admin Executive, Claims 
 
F +65 6725 0853   
E maybie.chua@budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 

From: Johari Bin Husin <JohariBH@sparkcarcare.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 January 2023 10:55 am 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Cc: Kelvin Su Khai Wen <kelvinsukwen@cdge.com.sg>; Oi Sun Pin <OiSunPin@cdge.com.sg>; Samuel Xie Ji Hao 
<samuelxie@cdge.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: PRI Request On 18-01-2023 || Ourf: C20019406/CH || GBB9044E DOA 21.12.2022 FBK177U  
 
Dear Sir / Madam. 
 

I proposed LKK  

 

Thank you. 
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Johari 

  

 

From: Johari Bin Husin <JohariBH@sparkcarcare.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 January 2023 10:38 am 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Cc: Kelvin Su Khai Wen <kelvinsukwen@cdge.com.sg>; Oi Sun Pin <OiSunPin@cdge.com.sg>; Samuel Xie Ji Hao 
<samuelxie@cdge.com.sg> 
Subject: GBB9044E DOA 21.12.2022 TP CLAIM AGAINTS FBK177U ( BUDEGET DIRECT ) 
  

Hi Sir / Madam , 

  

Kindly arrange for survey and i attach the repair estimate and GIA report. 

  

Thank you 

  

  

Best Regards, 

JOHARIBH 

  

Customer Care Specialist(Accident Repair) 

T: 63837419 / 97213705 

  


