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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 18 January 2023 4:11 PM
To: Sophia Soh Hui Ping
Cc: LKK Valuation
Subject: RE: VALUATION- REQUEST QUOTATION

Dear Sophia, 
 
Yes, we have inspected the vehicle. 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Sophia Soh Hui Ping <sophiasoh@sif.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 January 2023 2:55 PM 
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: VALUATION- REQUEST QUOTATION 
 
Hi Celine, 
 
I refer to our email dated 17 January 2023 (below). 
 
May I know if your team has inspected the vehicle? 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Sophia Soh 
Assistant Manager 
Credit Collection Department 
DID: 63050396 
Company Registration No. 196400348D 
 

 
 
This email and any files transmitted with it ("the Email") are confidential and are intended solely for the named addressee. If 
you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email for any purpose or disclose the 
contents to any person.  If you have received the Email in error, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your 
system and notify the sender by return email. Thank you. 
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From: Sophia Soh Hui Ping  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 January 2023 3:23 pm 
To: 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)' <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'LKK Valuation' <valuation@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: VALUATION- REQUEST QUOTATION 
 
Hi Celine, 
 
I refer to our email dated 13 January 2023 (below). 
 
May I know if your team has inspected the vehicle? 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Sophia Soh 
Assistant Manager 
Credit Collection Department 
DID: 63050396 
Company Registration No. 196400348D 
 

 
 
This email and any files transmitted with it ("the Email") are confidential and are intended solely for the named addressee. If 
you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email for any purpose or disclose the 
contents to any person.  If you have received the Email in error, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your 
system and notify the sender by return email. Thank you. 
 

From: Sophia Soh Hui Ping  
Sent: Friday, 13 January 2023 5:13 pm 
To: 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)' <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: VALUATION- REQUEST QUOTATION 
 
Hi Celine, 
 
Please assist with the formal valuation. 
 
The vehicle is at: 
 
Repoco Agency 
1 Bukit Batok Crescent  
10th Floor roof top WCEGA Plaza 
Singapore 658064 
 
Please do let us know the charges. Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Sophia Soh 
Assistant Manager 
Credit Collection Department 
DID: 63050396 
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Company Registration No. 196400348D 
 

 
 
This email and any files transmitted with it ("the Email") are confidential and are intended solely for the named addressee. If 
you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email for any purpose or disclose the 
contents to any person.  If you have received the Email in error, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your 
system and notify the sender by return email. Thank you. 
 

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 January 2023 5:45 pm 
To: Sophia Soh Hui Ping <sophiasoh@sif.com.sg> 
Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: VALUATION- REQUEST QUOTATION 
 
Dear Sophia, 
 
The valuation of SLX 4897J is as below: 
 
MV: $30,000.00                 FS: $26,500.00 
 
As at Jan 2023 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Sophia Soh Hui Ping <sophiasoh@sif.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 8:39 AM 
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: VALUATION- REQUEST QUOTATION 
 
Hi Celine, 
 
Attach is the Log card for a vehicle we will be auctioning (we will send you the password separately). 
 
We would be grateful if you could provide us an indicative valuation first. Subsequently, we will engage you for a 
formal valuation once there is a confirmed sales. 
 
Please do also let us know the cost of a formal valuation. Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Sophia Soh 
Assistant Manager 
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Credit Collection Department 
DID: 63050396 
Company Registration No. 196400348D 
 

 
 
This email and any files transmitted with it ("the Email") are confidential and are intended solely for the named addressee. If 
you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email for any purpose or disclose the 
contents to any person.  If you have received the Email in error, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your 
system and notify the sender by return email. Thank you. 
 


