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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Wee Loong TEO (SPF) <TEO_Wee_Loong@spf.gov.sg>
Sent: Monday, 16 January 2023 5:46 PM
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
Cc: assignments; SUR; Ramli ALI (SPF); Timothy KL LEE (SPF)
Subject: RE: [For Quotation] Assessment of Damage Repair Cost
Attachments: SKZ2048H.zip; 20230115_014716.jpg

Hi Bryan, 
 
            Please proceed to conduct the desk assessment on the cost of damage for the said vehicle.  The 
receipt for the repair and photos of the damage are as attached.   
 
2          Let me have the assessment report soonest possible.  
 
3          Thank you. 
 
 
 
Teo Wee Loong Alan 
OC Transport  
Corporate Services Branch, Traffic Police 
DID: (65) 6547 6128 | HP: (65) 9668 0416 
 

 
Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 
an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error. 

 
 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Saturday, January 7, 2023 12:36 PM 
To: Wee Loong TEO (SPF) <TEO_Wee_Loong@spf.gov.sg> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [For Quotation] Assessment of Damage Repair Cost 
 
Hi Alan 
 
Our fees to carry out a desktop assessment of the damage is $180/- excluding gst. 
 
Best Regards, 
Bryan Ang  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Wee Loong TEO (SPF) <TEO_Wee_Loong@spf.gov.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 6 January 2023 5:20 pm 
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [For Quotation] Assessment of Damage Repair Cost 
 
Hi Bryan, 
 
            TP has a case of vehicle damaged while it was impounded at TPVP by unknown person.  Vehicle 
owner had repaired the damage before he lodged a case with insurance company i.e. no surveyor 
assessment.   As the owner is claiming against TP, we would like to request for a quotation on the 
assessment of the repair cost for the damage based on attached photos. . 
 
2          For quotation, pl. 
 
 
Teo Wee Loong Alan 
OC Transport  
Corporate Services Branch, Traffic Police 
DID: (65) 6547 6128 | HP: (65) 9668 0416 
 

 
Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 
an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error. 

 
 


