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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 January 2023 3:52 PM
To: admin-d; assignments; SUR
Cc: Julie Mangubat; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim
Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10019886 /JM || OI-SLG6826R  (GREY) TP-SLH5845L || Est: 

$0 || RYDER AUTO PTE LTD
Attachments: C10019886 - SLH5845L.zip

Hi Team,  
 
We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SLH5845L 

Please kindly take note that the officer in-charge is Ms. Julie. , who is copied in the email.  
We appreciate if you can keep him in the loop. 

 

Please find attached GIA report for your reference, our insured has yet to make reporting. 
 
Thank you. 
Best regards, 
 
Maybie Chua 
Admin Executive, Claims 
 
F +65 6725 0853   
E maybie.chua@budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 January 2023 3:32 pm 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: PRI Request on 16-01-2023 || Our ref: C10019886 || SLH5845L & SLG6826R On 15 Jan 2023 
 
Dear  Maybie, 
 
 
Kindly assign LKK 
 
thank you 
 
Best regards  
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Orson 
 

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 January 2023 2:20 pm 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: PRI Request on 16-01-2023 || Our ref: C10019886 || SLH5845L & SLG6826R On 15 Jan 2023 

  

Dear Maybie, 

  

Kindly view attached our client's GIA report as requested. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best regards 

  

Orson 

  

 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 / 28, Autohub, Singapore 417921 

Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277 HP : 90908277 

 
  

 

  

  

On Tue, Jan 17, 2023 at 10:27 AM Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> wrote: 
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Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Good day to you!  

Kindly furnish us the GIA report for claim registration as our insured has yet to make reporting. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Maybie Chua 

Admin Executive, Claims 

  

F +65 6725 0853   

E maybie.chua@budgetdirect.com.sg 

  

 

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 

Singapore Shopping Centre 

Singapore 239924                                                                                                                      

budgetdirect.com.sg 
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget 
Direct Insurance. 

  

  

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 16 January 2023 4:10 pm 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle SLG6826R; Our Vehicle SLH5845L Accident involving 
SLH5845L & SLG6826R On 15 Jan 2023 

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

We refer to the above matter.   

  

Kindly find attached PRS for your necessary action.      

  

For Direct Settlement cases, we only use your in-house surveyor.  Kindly arrange your in-house surveyor. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best regards 

  

Zeph 

  

 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 / 28, Autohub, Singapore 417921 

Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277 HP : 90908277 
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--  

 
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 / 28, Autohub, Singapore 417921 
Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277 HP : 90908277 

 
 
 


