Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Veron,

Pre review done

Admin <support@insurlogic.net>
Saturday, 14 January 2023 12:18 AM
Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
claims@ergo.com.sg; Melody Teoh; SUR
Re: SMG 2290A-DOA: 10/1/2023

Pre Review By : Insurlogic

Amount : $5133.00

Check: $484.00
Total:$ 5617.00

Repair Duration: 4 days

On Fri, Jan 13, 2023 at 1:34 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Chee Wee,

Attach mark estimate.

Please assist urgent as repairer chasing for approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Insurlogic Support

Insurlogic Pte Ltd
7 Temasek Boulevard Level 32
Suntec Tower 1 Singapore 038987

Mobile: +65 89512166
Email: support@insurlogic.net
Website: www.insurlogic.net




