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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 May 2023 4:51 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: REQUEST LOD FOR GBA3450K
Attachments: Invoice GBA3450K.pdf; LOA.pdf; receipt-20230111-124624.pdf

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

We refer to the above mentioned.  

Attached is the repair invoice, LTA search receipt, LOA and below are the items our client wishes 
to claim from Lonpac Insurance. 
1. Repair costs                                $2,916.00 
2. Loss of use for 5 days                      600.00 
3. LTA search fee                                   26.75 
                                                        $3,542.75  
We look forward to an early settlement.  
 
 
Warmest regards, 
Steven 
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd 
82636295 
 
 
On Monday, 15 May 2023 at 11:48:35 am SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
 
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

Please submit LOD and claim documents to us. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, January 18, 2023 12:12 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com> 
Subject: FW: ESTIMATE FOR GBA3450K 

  

Hi, Hsiao Tong, 

  

  

CC4/LPC23000412/Kpa3 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 January 2023 11:47 AM 
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ESTIMATE FOR GBA3450K 

  

Dear Kenneth, 
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Please see attached documents. 

  

Warmest regards, 

Steven 

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd 

82636295 


