Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 March 2023 1:58 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team; paul.ong (paul.ong@wearnes.com)
Subject: RE: SMT3140A Finalise

Dear Paul,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $10,902.09 before GST with 4 days of repair, subject to
their approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, March 24, 2023 9:26 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SMT3140A Finalise

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>

Sent: Friday, 24 March 2023 9:25:51 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SMT3140A Finalise

Hi Rasul,

Attached for closing

Paul Ong

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103
M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336
www.wearnesauto.com  paul.ong@wearnes.com
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