Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 January 2023 6:10 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)

Cc: assignments; Meng Yan (LKK Auto); CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: TP DS claim: PRE REPAIR SURVEY - SKQ 754 M & XE 1950 R ACCIDENT ON 8
JANUARY 2023 *** | KK REF: CS3/AIS23000399/Upa3

Attachments: LKK RESURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf

Dear Shanti,
Please see survey photo as requested.

No DS and we will submit PRI report for this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 January 2023 10:10 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP DS claim: PRE REPAIR SURVEY - SKQ 754 M & XE 1950 R ACCIDENT ON 8 JANUARY 2023

Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 January 2023 6:07 PM

To: Progressive Auto Pte Ltd <claims@progressiveauto.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: TP DS claim: PRE REPAIR SURVEY - SKQ 754 M & XE 1950 R ACCIDENT ON 8 JANUARY 2023

Internal
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Your ref: SKQ 754 M
Our ref: XE 1950 R

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey)

File: SKQ754M(TP).pdf, XE1950R(OI).pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=dec625bf-accf-4484-a32e-69dcd68a7aca-65aad2423ac16336
Size: ~ 2 MByte, Download available until: 1/16/2023

Passwords will be sent in a separate email.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg
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This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Progressive Auto Pte Ltd <claims@progressiveauto.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, January 11, 2023 9:34 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] PRE REPAIR SURVEY - SKQ 754 M & XE 1950 R ACCIDENT ON 8 JANUARY 2023

Dear Shanti
As per requested, kindly refer to the attached for your reference and necessary action.
There is no LTA Search Fee for this case.

Thank you



BL Koh (Ms)

Progressive Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#02-50

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6844 4620 Fax: 6844 4625
Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat 0900 ~ 1800

From: "Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)" <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: 1/10/23 7:28 PM

To: "claims@progressiveauto.sqg" <claims@progressiveauto.sg>

Subject: RE: PRE REPAIR SURVEY - SKQ 754 M & XE 1950 R ACCIDENT ON 8 JANUARY 2023

Internal

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

Kindly provide us your client's GIA report and the LTA search.
Thank you.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department
at claims@allianz.com.sg

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg
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This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

From: Progressive Auto Pte Ltd <claims@progressiveauto.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, January 10, 2023 3:58 PM




To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: [EXT] PRE REPAIR SURVEY - SKQ 754 M & XE 1950 R ACCIDENT ON 8 JANUARY 2023

Dear Sir/ Madam
We refer to the above mentioned.
Kindly assist to send the surveyor list for selection to our workshop for surveying the vehicle.

We are instructed by our client to notify you of a road traffic accident which happened on 8 January 2023
along CTE Towards Woodlands Avenue 2 Junction Between Avenue 2 & Avenue 7 at about 0801hrs.

Drivers involving our client SKQ 754 M & XE 1950 R driven by your insurer or your insured's authorized
driver at the material time.

As a result of the accident, or client's vehicle has been damaged. Hence, before our client / we proceed
to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days upon receiving this notice
whether you or your insured would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the said vehicle without any
further reference to you.

Note : Vehicle is currently in our workshop.

Information on the vehicle can be inspected at : -

Name of Workshop : 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#02-50
Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Telephone no. : 6886 9097

Thank you

BL Koh (Ms)

Progressive Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#02-50

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit



Singapore 417883
Tel: 6844 4620 Fax: 6844 4625
Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat 0900 ~ 1800



