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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 7 February 2023 3:04 pm
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Cc: peggy; Admin A
Subject: FW: ACCD INLVG SLQ5585P AND XD8279E ON 09/01/2023
Attachments: SKMBT_C224e23013014240.pdf

Dear Lyna, 
 
Attached LOD for your necessary action. 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 30 January 2023 2:32 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCD INLVG SLQ5585P AND XD8279E ON 09/01/2023 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong 
 
We refer to the above matter and claiming against you as follows: 
 
Cost of repair                                                                                     $6,156.00 
Loss od use 5 days @$100 per day                                                  500.00 
Search fee                                                                                                    2.00 
                                                                                                                ------------ 
Total                                                                                                      $6,658.00 
                                                                                                                ======== 
 
Attach documents and please let us have your reply soon. 
 
 
REGARDS 
 






