Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: YT (MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 May 2023 12:03 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto); Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
Cc: 'YT(KB)'

Subject: RE: SJIT7679Y servicing records

Hi Veron,

Ok confirm.

LOD to be sent to whom?

Thanks.

Best Regards
7

Company Business Whatsapp: 6256 2081
Email: info@yewteegroup.com

Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD

I

NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:
Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61

Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

&5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, May 23, 2023 11:43 AM




To: YT(MG); Taufikh (LKKAuto); Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Cc: 'YT(KB)'; YT(KB)
Subject: RE: SJIT7679Y servicing records

Dear Sky,

Lump Sum $16,700 before excess $4250 @ 8 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, May 22, 2023 2:52 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; 'Sharon Tan Chow Yen' <sharon_tan@ecics.com.sg>; 'YT(KB)'
<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB) <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SJT7679Y servicing records

Importance: High

Hi,
Kindly please reply any updates on finalisation.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Company Business Whatsapp: 6256 2081
Email: info@yewteegroup.com

Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD




—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:
Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61

Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, April 25, 2023 12:39 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com; '‘Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)' <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; 'Sharon Tan Chow Yen' <sharon tan@ecics.com.sg>;
YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB) <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SJT7679Y servicing records

Hi Taufikh,
Kindly please finalise lump sum repair $17,200/- with 8 repair days.
Pending your actions in merimen.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD




—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:
Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61

Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 6:09 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com; '‘Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)' <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; 'YT(KB)' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; 'YT(KB)'
<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; 'YT(KB)' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB)
<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SJT7679Y servicing records

Importance: High

Hi Taufikh,
Kindly please finalise lump sum repair $17,200/- with 8 repair days.
Pending your actions in merimen.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD




—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:
Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61

Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, April 4, 2023 1:43 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com

Cc: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; 'YT(KB)' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; 'YT(KB)'
<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB) <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SJT7679Y servicing records

Importance: High

RESEND

Hi Taufikh,

Kindly please finalise lump sum repair $17,200/- with 8 repair days.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD




—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:
Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61

Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, March 18, 2023 11:04 AM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com

Cc: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; 'YT(KB)' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YT(MG)
<utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB) <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SJT7679Y servicing records

RESEND

Hi Taufikh,

Kindly please finalise lump sum repair $17,200/- with 8 repair days.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD




—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:
Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61

Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, February 20, 2023 5:45 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com

Cc: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB)
<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SJT7679Y servicing records

Hi Taufikh,
Attached after repair photos for your kind perusal.
Kindly please finalise lump sum repair $17,200/- with 8 repair days.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD




—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:
Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61

Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 9:53 AM

To: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; 'Sharon Tan Chow Yen' <sharon tan@ecics.com.sg>
Cc: YEW TEE GROUP <info@yewteegroup.com>

Subject: RE: SJT7679Y servicing records

Hi Sharon,
Kindly refer attachment the towing receipt.
The owner said that after the accident, he arrange for his tow truck to tow another workshop before towing to us.

Please assist reimbursement to the owner.

Thank you & Best Regards,

—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
HQ Office (North):

39 Woodlands Close,

#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856

DID: 6256 2081

Fax: 6256 2533

Email: info@yewteegroup.com

Branch Office (East):
Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road



Unit No #01-61

Singapore 417800

DID: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2 @singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your

system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, January 16, 2023 11:14 AM

To: 'Sharon Tan Chow Yen' <sharon tan@ecics.com.sg>

Cc: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB)
<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: SIT7679Y servicing records

Hi Sharon,
Attached owner’s servicing records as per requested.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD

—_—
TOLE TeutTio paateg)

YT

NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:
Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61

Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

5 please consider the environment before printing this email



Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
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