Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 July 2023 12:50 PM

To: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe)

Subject: RE: SKA8553H DOA:01/01/2023 OD/ALLIANZ
Dear Efeeda,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal cost of repair of $1,124.50 with 2 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, July 21, 2023 2:02 PM

To: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@Ikkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SKA8553H DOA:01/01/2023 OD/ALLIANZ

Hi,

Finalization and photos as attached.

Please let us have your confirmation on the COR $1124.50 via reply email.
Thank you.

Rgds

Efeeda

Cheng Hoe Motor PL
Tel:67556142
Fax:67557719

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, May 2, 2023 5:10 PM

To: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe)

Subject: RE: BEFORE REPAIR PHOTOS- SKA8553H DOA:01/01/2023 OD/ALLIANZ

Dear Efeeda,
Kindly advise the status of the stated vehicles:

If done for repair works, kindly send us the final bill for finalise.

Best Regards,



Xin Yu | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315 | email: xinyu@lkkauto.com / sur@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 11, 2023 2:13 PM

To: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: BEFORE REPAIR PHOTOS- SKA8553H DOA:01/01/2023 OD/ALLIANZ

Dear Efeeda,
Attached herewith our surveyor marked estimate for your pursuant.
As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKA 8553H (Excess $600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Xin Yu | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315 | email: xinyu@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 11, 2023 10:12 AM

To: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: BEFORE REPAIR PHOTOS- SKA8553H DOA:01/01/2023 OD/ALLIANZ

Dear Efeeda,

Received with thanks.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 11 January 2023 10:01 AM




To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: BEFORE REPAIR PHOTOS- SKA8553H DOA:01/01/2023 OD/ALLIANZ

Hi Yen,

Photos as attached.

Kindly let us have your surveyor’s markings and advice authorisation.
Thank you.

Rgds

Efeeda

Cheng Hoe Motor PL
Tel:67556142
Fax:67557719



