Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Sharon Tan Chow Yen <sharon_tan@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 January 2023 11:57 AM

To: assignments

Subject: EL Ref: DMPC2300015H/ST | 02. TPPD - SMA9217Z | Accdt invlvg SMN6035H

(ECICS) & SMA9217Z along VUE 8 residence basement carpark (washing bay) on
06/01/2023 1615 hours
Attachments: DMPC2300015H.7z

Hi Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.
Please arrange to survey SMA9217Z on a without prejudice basis.

Attached copy of both parties accident report for your perusal.

Best regards
Sharon Tan

Team Lead

2]
LSUF’GHCE
DID (65) 6303 0167 Tel (65) 6206 5588

Email Sharon Tan@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600

From: Sharon Tan Chow Yen

Sent: Tuesday, 10 January 2023 11:55 am

To: Hazel Natasya Chng <hazel@abwinm9.com>

Subject: EL Ref: DMPC2300015H/ST | 02. TPPD - SMA9217Z | Accdt invlvg SMN6035H (ECICS) & SMA9217Z along
VUE 8 residence basement carpark (washing bay) on 06/01/2023 1615 hours

Without Prejudice

Hi Hazel,

Thank you for your email.

We are agreeable to Direct Settlement.

Please submit your LOD with supporting documents in due course.

The claim for Loss of use and or rental per day will be strictly based on the NIMA benchmark and surveyor’s
recommendation.

Best regards

Sharon Tan

Team Lead



2]
LSUFGHCE
DID (65) 6303 0167 Tel (65) 6206 5588

Email Sharon Tan@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600

From: Hazel Natasya Chng <hazel@abwinm9.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 January 2023 11:46 am

To: Sharon Tan Chow Yen <sharon tan@ecics.com.sg>

Subject: RE: EL Ref: DMPC2300015H/ST | 02. TPPD - SMA9217Z | Accdt invlvg SMN6035H (ECICS) & SMA9217Z
along VUE 8 residence basement carpark (washing bay) on 06/01/2023 1615 hours

Hi Sharon,

We refer to your email below.

Please kindly assign LKK for the pre repair survey.

Aside from the above, please kindly let us have your liability clearance soonest possible.

Thank you and regards,
Hazel Chng

Claims Department
A B‘“,-' I h M® Antomaobile Pre Lid

=3 M9 Imternational Pte Lid
Abwin Service Pte Ltd
T +65 6713 9408 | Mobile +65 91991691 | F +65 6713 9415
No. 17 Kaki Bukit Road 4
#01-60 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417809

From: Sharon Tan Chow Yen <sharon tan@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 January 2023 11:14 am

To: hazel@abwinm9.com

Subject: EL Ref: DMPC2300015H/ST | 02. TPPD - SMA9217Z | Accdt invilvg SMN6035H (ECICS) & SMA9217Z along
VUE 8 residence basement carpark (washing bay) on 06/01/2023 1615 hours

Without Prejudice

Hi Hazel,

We refer to the above matter.

Our insured have lodged the accident report, please let us know which panel surveyor you have appointed.
We will write to them to bill to us.

Best regards
Sharon Tan

Team Lead



@
LSUI’HHCE
DID (65) 6303 0167 Tel (65) 6206 5588

Email Sharon Tan@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600.

From: Sharon Tan Chow Yen

Sent: Monday, 9 January 2023 2:48 pm

To: hazel@abwinm9.com

Subject: EL Ref: DMPC2300015H/ST | 02. TPPD - SMA9217Z | Accdt invilvg SMN6035H (ECICS) & SMA9217Z along
VUE 8 residence basement carpark (washing bay) on 06/01/2023 1615 hours

Without Prejudice

Hi Hazel,
We refer to the above matter.
Please be informed that our insured have not lodge the accident till date.

If the vehicle is in your workshop, suggest you appoint our list of panel surveyor (appended below) and you bear the
cost as an independent surveyor.

1. Ajax Inspection Services Pte Ltd

2. Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd

3. Infiniti Appraisal Services

4. LKK Auto Consultants

We will update you once our insured lodges the accident report.

Best regards
Sharon Tan

Team Lead

ECjCS

nsurance

DID (65) 6303 0167 Tel (65) 6206 5588
Email Sharon Tan@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg

Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600.

From: Hazel Natasya Chng <hazel@abwinm9.com>

Sent: Monday, 9 January 2023 10:44 am

To: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA9217Z AND SMN6035H ALONG VUE 8 RESIDENCE BASEMENT CARPARK
(WASHING BAY) ON 06/01/2023 AT ABOUT 1615HOURS

Hi,



We refer to the above matter.

We have been appointed by the owner, MR YEE ZHENYANG (YU ZHENYANG), the registered owner of vehicle no. SMA9217Z.

Kindly advise if your insured and/or insured driver has lodged a report regarding the above mentioned accident.

Please let us have your liability clearance for the above accident to proceed on with the claims.
Kindly arrange your surveyor to attend the Pre-repair inspection within 2 working days.
The said vehicle can be inspected at: 17 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-58/59/60/61/62 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417809.

Please note that if you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening Saturday,
Sunday and/or Public Holiday, the said workshop will commence repairs thereafter without any further notice or reference to you.

Thank you and regards,
Hazel Chng

Claims Department

WIN M® Automobale Pte Lid
"I-'i B 1l II =3 M9 Imternational Pte Lid

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

T +65 6713 9408 | Mobile +65 91991691 | F +65 6713 9415
No. 17 Kaki Bukit Road 4

#01-60 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417809

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking
expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply
email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking
expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply
email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking
expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply
email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.



