Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Sharon Tan Chow Yen <sharon_tan@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 9 January 2023 11:01 AM

To: assignments

Subject: EL Ref: DMPC2300001H/ST | 02. TPPD - SMP9535B | Accdt invlvg SJP4003M (ECICS)
& SMP9535B (Income) along Margaret Drive on 03/01/2023 13:12

Attachments: DMPC2300001H.7z

Hi Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

Understand that you have surveyed TPV SMP9535B earlier, at TSR Automotive Pte Ltd as independent survey.
Our insured has lodged the accident, please assist to bill us as panel survey and create case on Merimen.
Attached copy of estimate and both parties accident report for your perusal

Best regards
Sharon Tan

Team Lead

o
i‘ssurance
DID (65) 6303 0167 Tel (65) 6206 5588

Email Sharon Tan@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600

From: Sharon Tan Chow Yen

Sent: Monday, 9 January 2023 10:52 am

To: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022 @gmail.com>

Subject: EL Ref: DMPC2300001H/ST | 02. TPPD - SMP9535B | Accdt invivg SJP4003M (ECICS) & SMP9535B (Income)
along Margaret Drive on 03/01/2023 13:12

Without Prejudice

Hi Ryan,
Thank you for your call moments ago.
Please note that our insured has lodged the accident report.

As confirmed LKK Auto Consultants has conducted the survey earlier, we will write to LKK Auto Consultants to bill us
under panel survey.

We are agreeable to Direct Settlement, please submit your LOD with supporting documents in due course.

The claim for Loss of use and or rental per day will be strictly based on the NIMA benchmark and surveyor’s
recommendation.

Do let us know if you have any queries.



Best regards
Sharon Tan

Team Lead

8]
Lsurance
DID (65) 6303 0167 Tel (65) 6206 5588

Email Sharon Tan@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600.

From: Sharon Tan Chow Yen

Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 4:03 pm

To: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022 @gmail.com>

Subject: EL Ref: DMPC2300001H/ST | 02. TPPD - SMP9535B | Accdt invlvg SJIP4003M (ECICS) & SMP9535B (Income)
along Margaret Drive on 03/01/2023 13:12

Without Prejudice

Hi Ryan,

As our insured have not lodge the accident report, suggest you appoint our list of panel surveyor at your end and
you bear the cost as an independent surveyor.

We will update you once our insured lodges the accident report.

Best regards
Sharon Tan

Team Lead

8]
Lsurance
DID (65) 6303 0167 Tel (65) 6206 5588

Email Sharon Tan@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600.

From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022 @gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 3:53 pm

To: Sharon Tan Chow Yen <sharon tan@ecics.com.sg>

Subject: Re: EL Ref: DMPC2300001H/ST | 02. TPPD - SMP9535B | Accdt invlvg SJP4003M (ECICS) & SMP9535B
(Income) along Margaret Drive on 03/01/2023 13:12

Dear Sharon,

We wish to appoint LKK Auto Consultants .

Thanks



On Wed, 4 Jan 2023 at 15:50, Sharon Tan Chow Yen <sharon tan@ecics.com.sg> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Hi Ryan,
We refer to the above matter.
Please note that our insured has not lodge the accident report till date.

If the vehicle is in your workshop, suggest you appoint our list of panel surveyor (appended below) and you bear
the cost as an independent surveyor.

1. Ajax Inspection Services Pte Ltd

N

Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd

w

Infiniti Appraisal Services
4. LKK Auto Consultants
We will update you once our insured lodges the accident report.

Best regards
Sharon Tan

Team Lead

EC|CS

nsurance

DID (65) 6303 0167 Tel (65) 6206 5588

Email Sharon Tan@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg

Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600

From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022 @gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 12:41 pm

To: motorsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>

Subject: Fwd: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR SMP 9535B

Dear Sirs,



Attached scene photos & police report.

Will forward the GIA report when we receive it.

Thanks & regards
Ryan
93825367

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022 @gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 4 Jan 2023 at 11:10

Subject: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR SMP 9535B

To: <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>

Dear Sirs,

Please help us to arrange for a pre-repair survey

Our vehicle - SMP9535B

Accident date - 03/01/2023

Your insure - SJIP4003M

Location - TSR AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

160 SIN MING DRIVE

SIN MING AUTOCITY #06-01

SINGAPORE 575722

We will forward you the GIA report when we receive it



Kindly let us have the list of surveyors.

Thank you

Regards

Ryan

93825367

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking
expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply
email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.
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