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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 June 2023 11:19 AM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: ERGO REFF. CDMCG22002742  -  YP6192J and YN1128P TP Claims, Date of 

Accident 19 December 2022 along Loyang

  

From: Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 15 June 2023 11:18:26 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Liew Si Ming 
<LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>; Amencia A/P Albert Schweitze <Amencia@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: ERGO REFF. CDMCG22002742 - YP6192J and YN1128P TP Claims, Date of Accident 19 December 2022 

along Loyang 

Dear Rasul, 

  

Confirmed Finalised COR @ Lump Sum: $3,550.00 (before GST) with 4 working days. 

  

Thank you. 

  
NOTICE: 
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected. 
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us! 

 

Catherine Chong Kai Ling | Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:9736 1300 | f:   

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

 

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2023 11:15 AM 

To: Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: ERGO REFF. CDMCG22002742 - YP6192J and YN1128P TP Claims, Date of Accident 19 December 2022 

along Loyang 

  

Hi Catherine, 
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We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $3,550.00 /- with 04 days of 

repair before GST, subject to their approval. 

  

  

Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

  

From: Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 31 May 2023 4:56 pm 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>; 

Amencia A/P Albert Schweitze <Amencia@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: ERGO REFF. CDMCG22002742 - YP6192J and YN1128P TP Claims, Date of Accident 19 December 2022 along 

Loyang  

  

Dear Rasul, 

  

Kindly assist confirm Finalise COR @ L/S: $3,584.00 (before GST) with 4 working days. 

  

Thank you. 

  
NOTICE: 
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected. 
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us! 

 

Catherine Chong Kai Ling | Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:9736 1300 | f:   

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

 

  


