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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Ho <kenneth.ho@income.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 April 2023 4:37 PM

To: SUR; assignments; admin-d

Subject: FW: RE-send - SHC1065X AND SKG4291H ON 23.12.22 , Our ref: MT/1202542-002

Classification: Restricted  

 

Hi team, 

Please advise if the survey report for the above claim is ready. Thanks.  

Thanks and best regards, 

Kenneth Ho 
Assistant Manager 

Operations, Motor and Personal Lines  

T: (65) 6430 7929   

 

 

 

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the 

sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank you. 

 

 

From: Catherine Koh Mui Gek <catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 11 April 2023 4:01 pm 

To: Kenneth Ho <kenneth.ho@income.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: RE-send - SHC1065X AND SKG4291H ON 23.12.22 , Our ref: MT/1202542-002 

 

[CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you can confirm the sender and know the content is 

safe.] 

 

Dear Kenneth 

 

Taxi was surveyed by Irfan of NAC. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards 

Catherine Koh 

Claims Department | ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd 

Off : 62148733 

 

 

From: Kenneth Ho <kenneth.ho@income.com.sg> 

Sent: Monday, 10 April 2023 5:20 pm 

To: Sabrina Tan Quee Ping <SabrinaTan@cdge.com.sg> 

Cc: Catherine Koh Mui Gek <catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: RE-send - SHC1065X AND SKG4291H ON 23.12.22 , Our ref: MT/1202542-002  

  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment unless you know the sender.  

 

Classification: Restricted  

  

Our ref: MT/1202542-002 

  

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
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Save as to Costs 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

Please advise if the above claim is surveyed by our appoint surveyors. Thanks.  

Thanks and best regards, 

Kenneth Ho 

Assistant Manager 
Operations, Motor and Personal Lines  
T: (65) 6430 7929   
  

 

  

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the 

sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank you. 
  

  

From: Sabrina Tan Quee Ping <SabrinaTan@cdge.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 13 February 2023 9:30 am 

To: MTCL@income.com.sg 

Cc: Catherine Koh Mui Gek <catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg> 

Subject: RE-send - SHC1065X AND SKG4291H ON 23.12.22  

  

  
  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sir 

  

Refer to your email dated on 10 Feb '23. 

  

As requested, re-send ours LOD for your perusal and necessary action. 

  

Kindly review and settle our claims amicably with our Ms Catherine Koh who is copied herein. 

Tel: 6214 8733 Email: catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg 

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards 

Sabrina Tan  

Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd  

 

From: MTCL@income.com.sg <mtcl@income.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 10 February 2023 9:35 am 

To: Sabrina Tan Quee Ping <SabrinaTan@cdge.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: SHC1065X AND SKG4291H ON 23.12.22  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment unless you know the sender.  

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

Please assist to resend to us the LOD and supporting documents again for us to process the claim. 

Thank you 

Regards, 

Ignatius Koh  
Operations – Motor & Personal Lines 
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From: Sabrina Tan Quee Ping <SabrinaTan@cdge.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 26 January 2023 11:50 am 

To: NTUC - General Motor Claims <mtcl@income.com.sg> 

Cc: Catherine Koh Mui Gek <catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg> 

Subject: SHC1065X AND SKG4291H ON 23.12.22  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs 

M/s NTUC Income Insurance CO-OP Ltd 

Attached are our LOD documents for the above subject matter. 

Kindly review and settle our claims amicably with our Ms Catherine Koh who is copied herein. 

Tel: 6214 8733 Email: catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg 

Thank you 

Best Regards 

Sabrina Tan 

Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd  

 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and 

please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro 

Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. 

Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  

 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  

Disclaimer  

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, 

please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank you. 

  

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and 

please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro 

Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. 

Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  

 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  

  

Disclaimer  

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, 

please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank you. 

 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and 

please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro 

Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. 

Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  

 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  

 

Disclaimer  

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, 

please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank you. 


