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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: venus@jaydenfoods.com.sg
Sent: Thursday, 4 May 2023 11:19 PM
To: 'Lee, Ming-Yao'
Cc: 'Admin'; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG7554L(AIG) AND GBF3485J AT/ALONG UPPER 

CHANGI ROAD EAST ON 22/12/2022

Hi George  
 
Initially the driver of GBF3485J agreed with us to have private settlement, but after that he turned to 
workshop to do the accident report and claim without inform us. 
So we would like to confirm with you that we have no private settlement with the driver after 22/12/2022.  
Thank you very much. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Venus Tan (Mr) 
 
Jayden Foods Pte Ltd 
1550 Bedok North Ave 4,  
#02-14 Bedok Food City, 
Singapore 489950. 
 
Tel: +65 6280 5565 
 

 
 
 

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 4 May 2023 11:17 AM 
To: venus@jaydenfoods.com.sg 
Cc: 'Admin' <admin@jaydenfoods.com.sg>; 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG7554L(AIG) AND GBF3485J AT/ALONG UPPER CHANGI ROAD EAST ON 
22/12/2022 
 
Hi Ms. Venus, 
 
We received information that driver of GBF3485J also sustained injury as per his accident report. 
 
Could you kindly confirm on this from driver of GBF3485J for private settlement?  
 
If there is bodily injury, private settlement is not advisable. 
 
Regards, 
Lee Ming Yao, George 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
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AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1769 
Ming-Yao.Lee@AIG.com | www.AIG.sg 
 

From: venus@jaydenfoods.com.sg <venus@jaydenfoods.com.sg>  
Sent: 02 May 2023 09:21 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>; 'Admin' <admin@jaydenfoods.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG7554L(AIG) AND GBF3485J AT/ALONG UPPER CHANGI ROAD 
EAST ON 22/12/2022 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Miss Chew, 
 
The actual driver of the day was Mr Tan Kim In, he was standing at the roadside for his personal safety reason. 
He is also the owner of the vehicle no. GBG7554L.  
The driver of the vehicle GBF3485J said that he agreed to have private settlement for the accident. 
Therefore, they only exchanged mobile phone number instead of personal details. 
Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any clarification. 
 
Thank you very much. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Venus Tan (Mr) 
 
Jayden Foods Pte Ltd 
1550 Bedok North Ave 4,  
#02-14 Bedok Food City, 
Singapore 489950. 
 
Tel: +65 6280 5565 
 

 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, April 26, 2023 5:27 PM 
To: admin@jaydenfoods.com.sg 
Cc: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG7554L(AIG) AND GBF3485J AT/ALONG UPPER CHANGI ROAD EAST ON 
22/12/2022 
 
Dear Mr Tan, 
 
As spoken, attached is accident scene photos submitted by third party for your easy reference.  
 
Please confirm the actual driver during the time of accident. Thanks. 



3

 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, April 26, 2023 4:17 PM 
To: admin@jaydenfoods.com.sg 
Cc: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG7554L(AIG) AND GBF3485J AT/ALONG UPPER CHANGI ROAD EAST ON 
22/12/2022 
 
101 FOODS SUPPLIES                                     [By Email Only] 
 
Dear Mr Tan, 
  
You Ref: GBG7554L 
Our Ref: CC6/AIG23000179/Apa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG7554L(AIG) AND GBF3485J AT/ALONG UPPER CHANGI ROAD EAST ON 22/12/2022 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 
 
We have received a claim from GBF3485J against your insurance policy. 
 
As per our tele-conversation earlier, kindly assist to confirm the correct driver during accident as third party 
reported that your driver is Mr Liao XiaoLin instead of Mr Tan Kim In. Please proceed to do addendum report at 
reporting center and provide driver particular for our necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


