
Our Ref: SNC 2166 K 
 
Your Ref: YP 7901 Z 
 
14th February 2023 
 
Lonpac Insurance Bhd      BY EMAIL ONLY  
100 Beach Road        
Singapore 189702 
 
Dear Team,  

Re: Accident Involving SNC 2166 K & YP 7901 Z along 5 Changi North Way on 27th December 
2022 

We refer to the above accident and we are acting for the owner of SNC 2166 K for his Property 
Damage Claims. As a result of the above accident, our client has sustained losses as follows:  

Costs of Repairs (with GST)    $ 1,620.25 

Loss of Rental (4 days X $162.00)   $ 648.00 

GEARS Search      $ 33.00  

Total       $ 2,301.25 

We further enclosed herewith our supporting documents for the above claims: 

i.  Discharge voucher 

ii. Letter and Payment Authorization 

iii. Insurer Search Invoice 

 

 

Yours Sincerely, 

Joyce Low 







26/06/2023

26/06/2023



CAR TIMES AUTOLUTION PTE LTD 

Kaki Bukit: 13 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #03-15/16 Bartley Biz Ctr Singapore 417807 Tel: 6702 4282 

Sin Ming: 160 Sin Ming Drive #02-04/05 Autocity Singapore 575722 Tel: 6471 5111 

Toh Tuck: 32 Old Toh Tuck Road #02-11 I.Biz Centre Singapore 597658 Tel: 6980 3350 

Enterprise One: 1 Kaki Bukit Road 1 #02-24 Enterprise One Singapore 415934 Tel: 6980 5750
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CAR TIMES AUTOLUTION PTE. 

LTD.

13 Kaki Bukit Road 4, Bartley Biz Centre #03-15/16 

Singapore  417807

+65 67024282

autolution@cartimes.com.sg

GST Registration No. : 201605716G

Company Registration No. 201605716G

 

TAX INVOICE

BILL TO

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD - INSURANCE

INVOICE PB00859

DATE 03/02/2023

TERMS NET 30

DUE DATE 05/03/2023

VEHICLE NO

SNC2166K

MAKE & MODEL

TOYOTA NOAH

MILEAGE

-

ACTIVITY DESCRIPTION QTY RATE AMOUNT

Repair & Services - Claims COST OF REPAIR 1 1,500.23 1,500.23

 SUBTOTAL 1,500.23

GST TOTAL 120.02

TOTAL 1,620.25

BALANCE DUE S$1,620.25

Transfer the amount to the business account below.

________________________________ 

Issued by 

 

All cheque should be crossed and made payable to 

 

CAR TIMES AUTOLUTION PTE LTD 

OCBC Bank: 695 362343 001 (Servicing) 

OCBC Bank: 695 591768 001 (Claims)  

Paynow to UEN 201605716G



CAR TIMES AUTOLUTION PTE LTD CAR TIMES AUTO-RENT PTE LTD
201605716G GST No 201633634W

Invoice No CTAR - 0123/10046

Date

NO. CAR  NO.:

1 SML5483P 5/1/2023 TO 9/1/2023 600.00$          48.00$           

600.00$          48.00$           

Total Due 648.00$        

 

Remarks:

- Payments should be payable to:

Bank DBS BANK

Bank code 7171

Branch code 003

Account Name CAR TIMES AUTO-RENT PTE LTD

Account Number 0039520905

- Interest on overdue amount will be at the rate of $100 per month

This is a computer-generated document, no signature required.

This document shall not be invalidated solely on the ground that it is not signed.

CarTimes Auto-Rent Pte Ltd (ROC No: 201633634W)

61 Ubi Ave 2 Automobile Megamart #06-01 Singapore 408898

Tel (65) 6841 5111   Fax (65) 6846 9873   www.cartimes.com.sg

Tax Invoice

DESCRIPTION
S$ GST 8%

PERIOD



09/1/2023

150





TAX INVOICE

Date of Request: 31/12/2022
Your Ref No: SNC2166K

Dear Sir/Madam,

Date of Accident: 27/12/2022 00:00 (SGT)
Vehicle No: SNC2166K
Place of Accident: Changi N Way, Singapore

With reference to your application for the accident report, we have attached the following accident report as requested:

DOCUMENTS ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (S$) QTY AMOUNT (S$)

YP7901Z Changi N Way, Singapore (31.00 ) 1 (28.70 )

GST Amount (2.30 )

Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) (31.00 )

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General
Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no
liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

Thank you.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 26 June 2023 8:26 AM
To: 'CHARMAINE KONG'
Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - Our Ref SNC 2166 K (D.O.A. 27/12/2022) YP 7901 Z - PRI *** 

LKK REF: CC4/LPC23000174/Kpa3  //  Our Ref:  22/22/23/VC05/026762

Dear Sirs, 
 
For an update, we have settled the matter at a global sum of $2,040.00(all-in) with third party. 
 
We will proceed to close and submit all the relevant documents to your good office once it is ready.  
 
Thank you. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, May 30, 2023 2:49 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - Our Ref SNC 2166 K (D.O.A. 27/12/2022) YP 7901 Z - PRI *** LKK REF: 
CC4/LPC23000174/Kpa3 // Our Ref: 22/22/23/VC05/026762 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Please proceed as proposed. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Charmaine Kong 
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Claims Officer  | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.268 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, May 12, 2023 1:59 PM 
To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - Our Ref SNC 2166 K (D.O.A. 27/12/2022) YP 7901 Z - PRI *** LKK REF: 
CC4/LPC23000174/Kpa3 // Our Ref: 22/22/23/VC05/026762 
 
Your ref: 22/22/23/VC05/026762 
Our ref : C4/LPC23000174/Kpa3q2 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP7901Z(LONPAC) AND SNC2166K(TP) ON 27/12/2022 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour as he reversed and hit third party. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “CAR TIMES AUTOLUTION PTE LTD" at $2,042.05(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair (with 8% SGT) $ 6,786.72 $ 1,620.25 ($1,500.23 + 8%GST) 
2. Loss of RENTAL (4days x $150.00)(+8%GST) $    648.00 $     388.80 (3DAYS X $120.00)(+8%GST) 
3. LTA/ GIA SEARCH FEE $      33.00 $       33.00 

Total $ 7,467.72 $ 2,042.05 
   
Surveyor recommended 2days for repair. 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
  
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 02/05/2023 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Saturday, February 4, 2023 8:24 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref SNC 2166 K (D.O.A. 27/12/2022) YP 7901 Z - PRI *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC23000174/Kpa3 // Our 
Ref: 22/22/23/VC05/026762 
 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Hi Mei Kwan, 
 
OI has reported. 
 
We attach OI GIA. 
 
Thank you.  
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eng Huey Ni 
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9244 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 January 2023 7:09 pm 
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To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref SNC 2166 K (D.O.A. 27/12/2022) YP 7901 Z - PRI *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC23000174/Kpa3 
 
Dear Huey Ni, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please advise whether OI has reported the accident on 27.12.2022. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 January 2023 3:36 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref SNC 2166 K (D.O.A. 27/12/2022) YP 7901 Z - PRI 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 January 2023 2:26 PM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: Our Ref SNC 2166 K (D.O.A. 27/12/2022) YP 7901 Z - PRI 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Our Ref: 22/22/23/VC05/026762 ( Huey Ni’s case) 
 
Dear Meng Yan, 
 
FYNA. Attached copy of insured report. 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
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Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: claims@cartimes.com.sg <claims@cartimes.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 January 2023 2:17 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: bernard.yeow@cartimes.com.sg; justin.ee@cartimes.com.sg 
Subject: Re: Our Ref SNC 2166 K (D.O.A. 27/12/2022) YP 7901 Z - PRI 
 
Dear Claims, 
 
PRI have attached and kindly arrange survey the vehicle at level #07-17. 
 
Thank You. 
 
Best Regards, 
Huey Qi 
 

 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 


