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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Zero Gravity <zero_gravity@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 3 July 2023 4:34 pm
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: E-VOUCHER / OFFER / LOD GBE4774Z YOUR REF GBL9971B
Attachments: LETTER OF AUTHORITY - GBE4774Z.pdf

Dear Ezlyna/Admin, 
 
Kindly find the attachment & following Bank Details. 

 
 
Account Name:        ZERO GRAVITY 
Bank Name:              OCBC BANK 
Bank Account No.:  512-074923-001 
Bank Branch:            KATONG BRANCH 
Bank No:                   7339 
Swift Code:               OCBCSGSG 

 
 
Sylvie 
Zero Gravity 
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-25 Kaki Bukit Autohub  
Singapore 417921 
Tel: 6741 2845/6747 7100 
Fax:67412170 
 
 

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) [mailto:ezlyna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 3 July, 2023 12:04 PM 
To: Zero Gravity <zero_gravity@singnet.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: E-VOUCHER / OFFER / LOD GBE4774Z YOUR REF GBL9971B 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$5,336.75 (all in) in full and 

final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured 

arising out of this incident.  
 
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / 

Warrant to Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
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Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 

liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 

and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 30-Dec-2022.  
 
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 

payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
 
*Kindly provide BANK DETAILS to effect payment. 
 
Thank you.  
 
Warmest Regards,  
Ezlyna 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 
is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are 

not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others 

and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 
 
 

From: Zero Gravity <zero_gravity@singnet.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2023 6:33 PM 

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OFFER / LOD GBE4774Z YOUR REF GBL9971B 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong/Lyna, 
  
We would like to accept offer. Kindly let us have the DV form 
 
Thanks & Best regards 
 
Have a nice day! 
 
Sylvie 
Zero Gravity 
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-25 Kaki Bukit Autohub  
Singapore 417921 
Tel: 6741 2845/6747 7100 
Fax:67412170 
 
 

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) [mailto:ezlyna@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 28 June, 2023 2:35 PM 

To: Zero Gravity <zero_gravity@singnet.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OFFER / LOD GBE4774Z YOUR REF GBL9971B 
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Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sylvie, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have our principal’s instruction to offer as follows:- 
 

1. Cost of Repair $ 4,750.00 
2. Loss of Use (7 days x $80) $    560.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $      26.75 

Total $ 5,336.75 
 
Pls confirm acceptance & E-voucher will follow shortly.  Thank you. 
 
With warmest regards, 
Ezlyna  
 

From: Zero Gravity <zero_gravity@singnet.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, May 22, 2023 2:45 PM 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD GBE4774Z YOUR REF GBL9971B 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong/Lyna, 
  
This email is a reminder in regards to the LOD documents that we had sent you on 02 February 2023. There has 
been no update from your side. 
  
I know that you are busy, so just floating this to the top of your inbox in case you missed it. 
  
It would be really helpful if you could get back to us as soon as possible. 
 
Thanks & Best regards 
 
Have a nice day! 
 
Sylvie 
Zero Gravity 
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-25 Kaki Bukit Autohub  
Singapore 417921 
Tel: 6741 2845/6747 7100 
Fax:67412170 
 
 

From: Zero Gravity [mailto:zero_gravity@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 8 March, 2023 9:45 AM 

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'EzLyna (LKKAuto)' <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD GBE4774Z YOUR REF GBL9971B 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong/Lyna, 
  
This email is a reminder in regards to the LOD documents that we had sent you on 02 February 2023. There has 
been no update from your side. 
  
I know that you are busy, so just floating this to the top of your inbox in case you missed it. 
  
It would be really helpful if you could get back to us as soon as possible. 
 
Thanks & Best regards 
 
Have a nice day! 
 
Sylvie 
Zero Gravity 
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-25 Kaki Bukit Autohub  
Singapore 417921 
Tel: 6741 2845/6747 7100 
Fax:67412170 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Friday, 10 February, 2023 3:14 PM 

To: Zero Gravity <zero_gravity@singnet.com.sg>; EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: LOD GBE4774Z YOUR REF GBL9971B 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We are pending mandate approval from our principal. 
 
Hi Lyna, 
 
Pls assist to follow up. Thanks. 
 
 

 


