Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: 2020 SPRAYPAINTING <2020spraypainting@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 23 March 2023 10:14 AM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: SFH 1232C-DOA: 28/12/2022

Dear Huey Yon,

Please proceed.

Thank You.

Regards,

SHAH

Admin of

2020 SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD.

H/p: 97166502

Email: 2020spraypainting@gmail.com

On Thu, Mar 23, 2023 at 8:46 AM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of LS $3,800.00 with 5 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




