Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: nancy@casgarage.sg

Sent: Thursday, 16 February 2023 12:20 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: ‘Aldrin Ang’; catherine@casgarage.sg; 'Eng Chong Liau'
Subject: SKM 9179K-DOA: 30/12/2023

Dear Veron

Refer to the attachment.
We are pleased to accept the COR as L/S at $9,100.00 (B4 GST) / 09 repair days and will issue the LOD in due course.

Thank you and regards,
Nancy Lam

Hp: +65 8782 7171

Email: nancy@casgarage.sg
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GARAGE

Website: www.casgarage.sg
CAS Garage Pte Ltd

Address: 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#02-22/21/20 AutoBay Block D
Singapore 417883

Servicing Hotline: 9090 1222
UEN: 201828067M

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 15, 2023 5:05 PM

To: nancy@casgarage.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SKM 9179K-DOA: 30/12/2023

Dear Nancy,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $9,100/- with 9 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)






