Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 January 2023 11:17 AM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: Paper re-survey report on SJQ8857J ; DOA: 25.10.2022 // Our Ref:
22/22/22/VC05/026472 *** LKK REF: CS3/LPC22010692/Tqy3m4

Attachments: 2022.12.29-LOD to Lonpac for SJIQ8857)_compressed.pdf; Repair

Bill_compressed.pdf; Survey Report_compressed.pdf; GIA & Police Report of
SJQ8857J)_compressed.pdf; GIA report of GBE1646E_compressed.pdf; 2022.10.28-
Tax invoice from GIA_compressed.pdf; LTA search particulars_compressed.pdf; LTA
search fee_compressed.pdf; Colour Photos_compressed.pdf

Dear Assignment Team,

FYNA.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 January 2023 11:11 AM

To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Report <report@Ikkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
<celinefong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Paper re-survey report on SJQ8857J ; DOA: 25.10.2022 // Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/026472 *** LKK REF:
CS3/LPC22010692/Tqy3m4

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi SC,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@I|onpac.com>

Sent: Saturday, 31 December 2022 10:50 AM

To: Report <report@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
<celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: Paper re-survey report on SJQ8857J ; DOA: 25.10.2022 // Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/026472

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear all,

Please help to do a paper re-survey on TP veh SJQ8857J) and let us have your report soon.
We attach the claim documents (including survey report and colour photos)

Thanks

Huey Ni

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Kitty Tan <kitty tan@rssolomon.com>

Sent: Thursday, 29 December 2022 2:30 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; ENG HUEY NI
<hneng@lonpac.com>

Cc: Natalie Ng <natalie ng@rssolomon.com>; Lua SiewHui <lua_siewhui@rssolomon.com>

Subject: RE: TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJQ8857) AND GBE1646E ALONG UPPER CHANGI ROAD NORTH ON 25TH
OCTOBER 2022 AT ABOUT 1805 HRS [2210-7529 (ESL)(PD)]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs,

1. We act for Shaikh Ahmad Bin Shaikh Mohsin Alkhatib), the owner of vehicle no. SJQ8857J in the above
matter.

2. By way of email, we enclose herewith our letter dated 29" December 2022 and the relevant documents
for your attention.

3. Kindly please let us have an acknowledgement of receipt for our Letter of Demand.
4. We hope to hear from you soon for an amicable settlement of our client’s claim.
Thank you and best regards,

Kitty Tan | Legal Secretary
R. S. Solomon LLC
Advocates & Solicitors

300 Beach Road
The Concourse #12-02/03/04
Singapore 199555

T: +656817 7498




F: +65 6292 2665
E: kitty tan@rssolomon.com

S

R 5. SOLOMON LLC

The contents of this email (including any attachment) are strictly confidential and may contain privileged information. If you are
not the intended recipient, please notify us IMMEDIATELY and delete this email (including any attachments) from your computer
system. Thank you.



