Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 5:09 PM

To: Chitra; jessvir@kertarlaw.com.sg; kertar@kertarlaw.com.sg; anil@kertarlaw.com.sg;
soumotorclaims@hotmail.com

Cc: assignments; Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Subject: AIS REF: TBC/KC - /SJK129L ACCIDENT ON 26 NOVEMBER 2022 AT 0315hrs
ALONG HOLLAND ROAD INVOLVING FBT 792T AND SJK 129L | Our ref:
KS/P10702/22/cs

Internal

Your ref: KS/P10702/22/cs
Our ref: TBC/KC - /SIK129L

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Thank you.

Janice Koh

Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQD | Allianz @ | (.

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralymplc Postner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Chitra <chitra@kertarlaw.com.sg>

Sent: 30 December, 2022 01:31 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: jessvir@kertarlaw.com.sg; kertar@kertarlaw.com.sg; anil@kertarlaw.com.sg; soumotorclaims@hotmail.com
Subject: [EXT] RE: AIS REF: TBC/KC - /SIK129L ACCIDENT ON 26 NOVEMBER 2022 AT 0315hrs ALONG HOLLAND
ROAD INVOLVING FBT 792T AND SJK 129L | Our ref: KS/P10702/22/cs

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

Our clients are agreeable to have LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as the motor surveyor.



Kindly liaise with Mr Ah Huat @ 6273 0369 to fix an appointment.
In the interim, all our clients rights are reserved.
Thank you.

Regards
Chitra

For and on behalf of Ms Jessvir Kaur

Kertar & Sandhu LLC

133 New Bridge Road #11-10 Chinatown Point Singapore 059413
T: +(65) 6536 6266 | F: +(65) 6557 0313

Email: chitra@kertarlaw.com.sg

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) [mailto:claims@allianz.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 11:45 AM

To: Chitra <chitra@kertarlaw.com.sg>; jessvir@kertarlaw.com.sg; kertar@kertarlaw.com.sg;
anil@kertarlaw.com.sg

Subject: AIS REF: TBC/KC - /SJK129L ACCIDENT ON 26 NOVEMBER 2022 AT 0315hrs ALONG
HOLLAND ROAD INVOLVING FBT 792T AND SJK 129L | Our ref: KS/P10702/22/cs

Internal

Your Ref: KS/P10702/22/cs
Our Ref : TBC/KC - /SJK129L

Dear Sirs

Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-
AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd

A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd

Form Team Consultancy Pte Ltd
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.

Best regards,

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQL | Allianz @) | (.o

Warldwides Olymplc ond Porolymplc Portner




Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Chitra <chitra@kertarlaw.com.sg>

Sent: 29 December, 2022 05:12 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cec: jessvir@kertarlaw.com.sg; kertar@kertarlaw.com.sg; anil@kertarlaw.com.sg

Subject: [EXT] Pre repair inspection | ACCIDENT ON 26 NOVEMBER 2022 AT 0315hrs ALONG
HOLLAND ROAD INVOLVING FBT 792T AND SJK 129L | Our ref: KS/P10702/22/cs

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,
We act for the rider of FBT 792T, Ms Saengprasit Paweena , on the above captioned matter.
As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged.

Please let us know within the next TWO (2) working days whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair
survey of the vehicle .

We attach herewith our self-explanatory letter and our client’s accident report for your necessary action.
If we do not hear from you within the stipulated time, our client shall procced to repair the said vehicle
Thank You.

Regards
Chitra

For and on behalf of Ms Jessvir Kaur

Kertar & Sandhu LLC

133 New Bridge Road #11-10 Chinatown Point Singapore 059413
T: +(65) 6536 6266 | F: +(65) 6557 0313

Email: chitra@kertarlaw.com.sg




