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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 6 April 2023 4:37 pm
To: miketanlg@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE3282H (CHINA TAIPING) AND SHA5748T AT/ALONG 

KIM KEAT LINK ON 01/11/2022
Attachments: GBE3282H GIA REPORT.pdf

M/S LG TAN ENTERPRISE 
 
Dear Mr Mike Tan, 
 
We refer to the above matter and our previous tele conversation. 
 
We have previously emailed the below stated letter to your driver based on the accident report (your email was not 
found).  Pls find enclosed herewith a copy of Accident Report lodged by your employee – Mr Tan Sean Gee. 
 
As Loss Adjuster appointed by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd and as to save costly litigation, we will handle 
& settle third party claim (property damage) with the total sum of $6,262.01.  Letter of Demand & Surveyor Report will 
submit to China Taiping Insurance for approval before payment make to third party by your insurer. 
 
If you have any further enquiry, pls do contact me via email.  Thank you. 
 
*I am working from home from 04.04.2023~12.05. 2023.  If you wish to contact me, pls whatsapp call at 80287880 or 
email. 
 
Best Regards, 
Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler   
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, January 13, 2023 10:35 AM 
To: dantansgtan@gmail.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE3282H (CHINA TAIPING) AND SHA5748T AT/ALONG KIM KEAT LINK ON 01/11/2022 
 
Our Ref: CC3/CTI23000001/Tpa3 
 
Insured Name : LG TAN ENTERPRISE 
Insured Driver : Tan Sean Gee 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
                                           
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE3282H (CHINA TAIPING) AND SHA5748T AT/ALONG KIM KEAT LINK ON 
01/11/2022 
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We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.
 
We have received a claim from SHA5748T against your motor insurance policy. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver’s favour. 
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 


