Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, December 30, 2022 4:52 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Claims; Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: Re: AIS REF: 2022 22009225FR-XD9535J9 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMT 954 M AND

YOUR INSURED XD 9535 J DATED 29/12/21022

Categories: HMK

Dear Janice,

Thank you for the assignment.

Dear George,

We will arrange survey on the date mentioned.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 4:38 pm

To: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: AIS REF: 2022 22009225FR-XD9535J9 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMT 954 M AND YOUR INSURED XD 9535 J DATED
29/12/21022

Internal

Your ref: SMT 954 M
Our ref: 2022 22009225FR-XD9535J9

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.



Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Thank you.

Janice Koh

Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQ | Alianz @ | (.o
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sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.
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From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: 30 December, 2022 11:32 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMT 954 M AND YOUR INSURED XD 9535 J DATED 29/12/21022

Dear all,

Kindly assist in the liability clearance for above mentioned case. We are in the opinion that our client is not the
proximate cause of the accident.

Therefore, we propose for direct settlement at 100% liability clearance in our clients favour.
Please advise who the officer in-charge we shall liaise with.

Attached are the GIA report for your reference and we will send you the estimate once it is ready.
Please arrange car survey on 05/01/2023 @10.30am. 55 Ubi Road 1. Owner Waiting.

Thank you.

Best regards,
George Wong
Claims advisor

PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES
(Reg No 199902271W)
281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938
p. +65 6366 2323 d. 66900293
e. Claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 68362223
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