Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, December 30, 2022 9:09 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); assignments; Admin A

Subject: Re: AIS REF: 2022 22009117/KC - GBG1337L - - SLQ 5115 M & GBG 1337 L // ACCIDENT
ON 15 DECEMBER 2022

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: HMK

Dear Janice,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 29 December 2022 4:55 pm

To: assighments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIS REF: 2022 22009117/KC - GBG1337L - - SLQ 5115 M & GBG 1337 L // ACCIDENT ON 15 DECEMBER 2022

Internal

Dear Survey Firm,
Please retrieved documents via Allianz FileXchange link below and create claim in Merimen accordingly.
File: POLICY SCHEDULE.pdf, GBG1337L Ol.pdf, SLQ5115M TP.pdf,...

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=61f323fd-e06e-41df-bfaf-ff3bb6e97d7c-491dabaf5dcfe53a
Size: ~ 4 MByte, Download available until: 1/12/2023

Password: Allianz1

Thank you

Janice Koh



Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQL | Allianz @) | (.o

Warldwides Olymplc ond Porolymplc Portner
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.
& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)

Sent: 29 December, 2022 04:54 PM

To: 'claims@focusauto.com.sg' <claims@focusauto.com.sg>; focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: AIS REF: 2022 22009117/KC - GBG1337L --SLQ 5115 M & GBG 1337 L // ACCIDENT ON 15 DECEMBER 2022

Your ref: SLQ 5115 M
Our ref: 2022 22009117/KC - GBG1337L

Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Thank you.

Janice Koh

Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQ | Alianz @ | (.o

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralymplc Postner
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.
& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Focus Auto Pte Ltd <claims@focusauto.com.sg>

Sent: 29 December, 2022 02:57 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg

Subject: [EXT] PRE REPAIR SURVEY - SLQ 5115 M & GBG 1337 L // ACCIDENT ON 15 DECEMBER 2022

Dear Sir / Madam

We refer to the above mentioned.



Kindly assist to send the surveyor list for selection to our workshop for surveying the vehicle.

We are instructed by our client to notify you of a road traffic accident which happened on 15 December 2022 along
CTE Towards 15 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 at about 1830hrs.

Drivers involving our client SLQ 5115 M & GBG 1337 L driven by your insurer or your insured's authorized driver at
the material time.

As a result of the accident, or client's vehicle has been damaged. Hence, before our client / we proceed to repair
the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days upon receiving this notice whether you or your
insured would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the said vehicle without any further reference to you.

Information on the vehicle can be inspected at : -

Name of Workshop 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#02-50
Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Telephone no. : 6886 9097

Thank you

Best Regards

Jenny Koh

Focus Auto Pte Ltd

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#02-50

AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 68444625

Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800



