Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: sharon@sngahtee.com

Sent: Monday, 5 June 2023 10:07 AM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto); darren@sngahtee.com; 'SATM ADMIN'
Subject: RE: Supplementry items for SDH681U OD Allianz

Hi Huey Yon

Amount confirm.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHTE

MOTOR & PAMEL'SE

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, June 5, 2023 8:31 AM

To: sharon@sngahtee.com; darren@sngahtee.com; 'SATM ADMIN' <admin@sngahtee.com>
Subject: RE: Supplementry items for SDH681U OD Allianz

Dear Sharon,
Any updates?

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 23, 2023 4:50 PM

To: sharon@sngahtee.com; darren@sngahtee.com; 'SATM ADMIN' <admin@sngahtee.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Supplementry items for SDH681U OD Allianz




Dear Sharon,
Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $9,099.60 before excess $800.00 and GST with 3 days
of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: sharon@sngahtee.com <sharon@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 23, 2023 3:34 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; darren@sngahtee.com; 'SATM ADMIN' <admin@sngahtee.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@l|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Supplementry items for SDH681U OD Allianz

Hi Huey Yon

Please check & confirm.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHT

MOTOR & PAMEL'SE

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, May 5, 2023 2:07 PM

To: darren@sngahtee.com; sharon@sngahtee.com; SATM ADMIN <admin@sngahtee.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Supplementry items for SDH681U OD Allianz

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly provide us parts invoice, final bill and before paint photos for finalise.



Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, January 16, 2023 11:56 AM

To: darren@sngahtee.com

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Supplementry items for SDH681U OD Allianz

Dear Darren,
Kindly provide us the before paint photos.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: darren@sngahtee.com <darren@sngahtee.com>
Sent: Friday, 13 January 2023 2:02 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Supplementry items for SDH681U OD Allianz

Hi Huey Yon,
We have submitted the supplementary items into merimem.
Thank you

Best Regards

Darren Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD

3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
HP: 91181186

TEL: 62686183 (4LINES)

FAX: 62681429

Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHT

MOTOR & PAMEL'SE

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 13 January, 2023 08:57 AM

To: darren@sngahtee.com

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Supplementry items for SDH681U OD Allianz
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Hi Darren,

Kindly provide the supplementary list with pricing and upload it in merimen system as we need to get further
approval from our principle.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: darren@sngahtee.com <darren@sngahtee.com>
Sent: Thursday, 12 January 2023 5:33 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Supplementry items for SDH681U OD Allianz

Huey Yon,

With reference to the above, we do have supplementary and question mark items.
Please view the photos as attached.

Supplementary item are:

Frt bumper sponge

Frt bumper reinforcement

Frt headlamp nozzle bracket LH

Frt parking sensor wiring

Best Regards

Darren Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD
3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
HP: 91181186

TEL: 62686183 (4LINES)

FAX: 62681429

Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHT

MOTOR & PAMEL'SE




