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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: HK Ong <hk.ong@mova.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 16 February 2023 6:21 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team
Cc: jiayu@mova.com.sg; 'Suanne Chiu'; keesiokkiang@mova.com.sg
Subject: RE: SLT 1719G  Finalize calculation and discharge photos

Dear Veron, 
 
We accept your offer @ L/Sum $6,300.00 with 4 days. 
 
Thank You. 
 
Best Regards, 
Ong 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 9:45 AM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Ong Hock 
Kong' <hk.ong@mova.com.sg> 
Cc: jiayu@mova.com.sg; 'Suanne Chiu' <suann@mova.com.sg>; keesiokkiang@mova.com.sg 
Subject: RE: SLT 1719G Finalize calculation and discharge photos 
 
Dear Mr Ong, 
 
 
“Without Prejudice” 
 
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $6300/- before excess $500 with 4 days of repair, 
subject to their approval.  
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 14 February 2023 7:38 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: SLT 1719G Finalize calculation and discharge photos 
 
  

From: HK Ong <hk.ong@mova.com.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 14 February 2023 7:37:36 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'JIAYU' <jiayu@mova.com.sg>; 'Suanne Chiu' <suann@mova.com.sg>; keesiokkiang@mova.com.sg 
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<keesiokkiang@mova.com.sg> 
Subject: SLT 1719G Finalize calculation and discharge photos 

Dear Rasul, 
  
Attached finalize calculation and discharge photos for your attention. 
Kindly assist to finalize as vehicle been discharged. 
  
Thank You. 
  
Best Regards, 
Ong 
  


