Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Vonn Siow <vonn_siow@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 1:17 PM

To: Elite Automotive SG

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: OD Claim For Vehicle No: SDG1600C - MSIG claim ref: OD / 294970 - DOA:
14/12/2022

Hi Christy

Thank you for the acceptance on our offer at lump sum not exceeding $7,800.00 (all-in including supplementary
and check items). Subject to excess $700.00.

Please wait for the update from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd on the authorization before proceed to repair.
Have a great day!

Vonn Siow

Assistant Executive, Claims Services

D: +65 6012 1349 | vonn _siow@sg.msig-asia.com
Please note my direct line has changed.
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5% Join our mission in protecting our planet, please consider the environment before you print.

From: Elite Automotive SG <elite.automotivel3@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 12:38 pm

To: Vonn Siow <vonn_siow@sg.msig-asia.com>

Subject: Re: OD Claim For Vehicle No: SDG1600C - MSIG claim ref: OD / 294970 - DOA: 14/12/2022

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s).

Hi Vonn,

Good day! We can accept the offer Lump Sum not exceeding-$7800.00 (Bf GST). Can we start repair or still pending
approval? Thanks!

Regards,

Christy
Elite Automotive P/L
63397378



On Thu, 29 Dec 2022 at 17:27, Vonn Siow <vonn_siow@sg.msig-asia.com> wrote:

Hi Christy

We refer to the subject above.

We will offer our repair amount at lump sum not exceeding $7,800.00 (all-in including supplementary and check
items).

Subject to excess $700.00.

Kindly confirm your acceptance on our offer.

Thank you.

Have a great day!

Vonn Siow

Assistant Executive, Claims Services

D: +65 6012 1349 | vonn_siow(@sg.msig-asia.com

Please note my direct line has changed.
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From: Elite Automotive SG <elite.automotivel3@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 23 December 2022 4:49 PM

To: Motor Survey <motorsurvey@sg.msig-asia.com>
Subject: OD Claim For Vehicle No: SDG1600C

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s).

Hi,

Good day! Kindly refer to attached estimate and arrange surveyor come down for survey.

Thanks!

Regards,

Christy

Elite Automotive P/L

Tel : 6339 7378



CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any
person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.

Regards,
Elite Automotive P/L

Tel : 6339 7378



