Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Elite Automotive SG <elite.automotive13@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 3 February 2023 2:14 PM

To: Finalization

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SDG1600C - OD / 294970

Hi Veron,

Good day! We accept above offer-56450.00 (Bf GST). Thanks!

Regards,

Christy
Elite Automotive P/L
63397378

On Fri, 3 Feb 2023 at 14:12, Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Christy,

Kindly refer amend finalize.

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $6450 (L/S, before GST), 6 days. Subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Elite Automotive SG <elite.automotivel3@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, February 3, 2023 1:49 PM

To: Finalization <finalization@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SDG1600C - OD / 294970

Hi Veron,



Kindly refer to attached marked estimate & got supplementary labour, kindly re-calculate the COR. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy

On Fri, 3 Feb 2023 at 12:12, Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Christy,

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $6400 (L/S, before GST), 6 days. Subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 1:32 PM

To: elite.automotivel3@gmail.com; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SDG1600C - OD / 294970

Dear Chrsity,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SDG 1600C at lump sum not
exceeding $7,800.00 (all-in including supplementary and check items) (Excess $700/-).



If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Elite Automotive SG <elite.automotivel3@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 29 December 2022 3:27 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FW: SDG1600C - OD / 294970

Hi Veron,

Good day! Kindly refer to attached. Thanks!

Regards,

Christy

Elite Automotive P/L
63397378

On Thu, 29 Dec 2022 at 09:36, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Christy,

FYNA

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



ender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.

Regards,
Elite Automotive P/L

Tel : 6339 7378

Regards,
Elite Automotive P/L

Tel : 6339 7378

Regards,
Elite Automotive P/L

Tel : 63397378



