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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 May 2023 10:11 AM

To: Thomas Pang   PTCBC

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Finalize Report SMK3357P

Hi Thomas 

  

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $9,864.54 /- with 09 days of repair before GST, subject to their approval. 

 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  
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From: Thomas Pang PTCBC <Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 28 April 2023 10:43 am 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Finalize Report SMK3357P  

  

RESEND 

  

From: Thomas Pang PTCBC  

Sent: Saturday, April 1, 2023 10:18 AM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKK Auto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Finalize Report SMK3357P 

  

RESEND 

  

From: Thomas Pang PTCBC <Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, February 28, 2023 6:41 PM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Finalize Report SMK3357P 

  

Hi,  

  

Attach finalize report for your perusal.  

  

Thank you 

  

Regards  

  

Thomas pang 

  

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 28 February 2023 5:51 pm 

To: Thomas Pang PTCBC <Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg> 

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Finalize Report SMK3357P  

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content 

is safe. 
Dear Thomas, Kindly send us the final bill of SMK 335 7P. Best Regards, Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lt d Phone: 6 256 -356 1 | email: siewsc@ lkkauto. com | fax: 6 256 -4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1 ,  
Dear Thomas, 
  
Kindly send us the final bill of SMK 3357P. 
  
Best Regards, 
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
-----Original Message----- 
From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, February 28, 2023 1:09 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: Finalize Report SMK3357P 
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________________________________________ 
From: Thomas Pang   PTCBC <Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 28 February 2023 1:09:05 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Finalize Report SMK3357P 
  
Dear Rasul, 
  
Attach finalize report for your perusal. 
  
Thank you 
  
Regards 
  
Thomas Pang 


