
1

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 16 February 2023 3:17 PM
To: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz; Rasul (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR
Subject: RE: FINALIZED: SLL5050S DOA: 21/12/2022 (MSFCIL: D22004043MFBP) 

Dear Paulo, 

 

“Without Prejudice” 

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $9,729.61 before GST. 4 days repair. 
  

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz <juan.paulo@wearnes.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 16 February 2023 2:40 PM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FINALIZED: SLL5050S DOA: 21/12/2022 (MSFCIL: D22004043MFBP)  
Importance: High 

 

Dear Rasul, 
  
Kindly check & confirm finalized amount $9,729.61 before GST (part by part). 4 days repair. 
  
Attached before paint & after repair photos. 
  
Thank you  
 
Paulo 
Service Consultant 
Bodyshop & Paint  
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Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd 
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103 
M (65) 98270463  
www.wearnesauto.com      juan.paulo@wearnes.com 
  

  
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.  
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.  
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you. 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Sunday, 5 February 2023 4:05 pm 
To: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz <juan.paulo@wearnes.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (MSFCIL: D22004043MFBP)-SLL 5050S  

 

Dear Paulo, 

Kindly advised vehicle repair status. 

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, 5 January 2023 11:49 AM 
To: juan.paulo@wearnes.com 
Subject: FW: New Assignment (MSFCIL: D22004043MFBP)-SLL 5050S  

 

Dear Paulo, 

Kindly advised vehicle repair status. 

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  
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Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 23 December 2022 4:51 PM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: juan.paulo@wearnes.com; Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Rachel Wu 
<RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: New Assignment (MSFCIL: D22004043MFBP) 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm,  
 
Attached documents for survey assignment. 
 
 
Insured Vehicle No : SBS3501C 
TP Vehicle No      : SLL5050S 
Claim No           : D22004043MFBP 
Workshop Name      : WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD 
Our Surveyor       : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 
Instructions       : Without Prejudice 
 
Created By         : JOANNTAN 
Verified By        : RACHELWU 
Approved By        : RACHELWU 
 
 
 
This is a computer generated mail. Do not reply to this mail. 
 
 
 


