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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 19 January 2023 11:11 am
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Cc: jouis; Admin A
Subject: FW: Accident involving GBL2696S (Nissan Nv200) & SNA6223M (Aig) on 22/12/22 *** 

LKK REF: CC6/AIG22012836/pa3
Attachments: GBL2696S LOA.pdf; GBL2696S RENTAL AGREEMENT.pdf

Hi Lyna, 
 
FYNA, Thanks. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 13 January 2023 3:30 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Accident involving GBL2696S (Nissan Nv200) & SNA6223M (Aig) on 22/12/22 *** LKK REF: 
CC6/AIG22012836/pa3  
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sir /Madam 
 
 
 
We submit our claim as follow :  
 
Cost of  Repair  S$ 3132.00 
RENTAL      S$       360.00  (Surveyor’s recommended 3days  ) 
 Total           S$ 3492.00 
 
Please let us have your offer to settle.   
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Thank you & Best  Regards, 
Jouis Seow  
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd 
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10  
Singapore 539195. 
  
Tel        : (65) 62898126 
Fax       : (65) 62870590 
Email    : jouis@jinauto.com.sg  
  
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 28 December 2022 9:09 AM 
To: JIN AUTO SERVICES <jin@jinauto.com.sg>; EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: jouis@jinauto.com.sg; jordan@jinauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving GBL2696S (Nissan Nv200) & SNA6223M (Aig) on 22/12/22 *** LKK REF: 
CC6/AIG22012836/pa3  
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 
 

   

 
 
Please arrange for survey. 

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Lyna. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 








