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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Kee Mui Hong - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <muihong@almsm.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 6 April 2023 9:47 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; Meili - ALM SM
Subject: Re: Claim Document for Our Client Vehicle SJG8766R with Allianz Insured Vehicle 

SNG6157P acc on : 14/12/2022 15:49 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22012801/Kpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
  
Noted and Thanks ! Please pay to our Sin Ming account as follows  
  
Name of Bank – DBS 
Account Holder – Ah Lim Motor Company 
Account Number – 0239029710 
  
Or 
  
PayNow UEN – 06470300B Ah Lim Motor Company 
  
Email to notify payment – muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg 
  
Please do indicate our vehicle number or Invoice number or Claim Reference number for us to trace the 
payment. 
  
Thank You 
  
Best Regards, 
 
Kee Mui Hong 
Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming 
Tel : 64563637 Fax : 64563686 
  
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: 05 April, 2023 5:28 PM 
To: mailto:muihong@almsm.com.sg  
Cc: Admin A  
Subject: RE: Claim Document for Our Client Vehicle SJG8766R with Allianz Insured Vehicle SNG6157P acc on : 
14/12/2022 15:49 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22012801/Kpa3 
  
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
  
Dear Sirs 
  
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$2,354.00 (all in) in full and 
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured 
arising out of this incident.  
  
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of your Bank details for us to process 
payment.   
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Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 14 DEC 2022.  
  
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
  
Thank you.  
  
  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Kee Mui Hong - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <muihong@almsm.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, March 29, 2023 10:33 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Claim Document for Our Client Vehicle SJG8766R with Allianz Insured Vehicle SNG6157P acc on : 
14/12/2022 15:49 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22012801/Kpa3 
  
Dear Claims, 
  
Please see attached the Claim Document for Our Client Vehicle SJG8766R with Allianz Insured Vehicle 
SNG6157P acc on : 14/12/2022 15:49 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22012801/Kpa3 
  
Please advise your offer. 
  
Thanks ! 
  
Best Regards, 
 
Kee Mui Hong 
Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming 
Tel : 64563637 Fax : 64563686 
  
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: 05 January, 2023 5:18 PM 
To: gerald@almsm.com.sg  
Cc: mailto:meili@almsm.com.sg ; Admin A  
Subject: RE: 2nd Liability Check - Our Client Vehicle SJG8766R Insured Under Direct Asia Against Your Insured 
Vehicle SNG6157P acc on : 14/12/2022 15:49 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22012801/Kpa3 
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs, 
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We refer to the above matter.   
  
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under 
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned 
case. 
  
Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to 
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the 
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the 
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal. 
  
Thank you. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 January 2023 1:52 PM 
To: gerald@almsm.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MeiLi Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <meili@almsm.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: 2nd Liability Check - Our Client Vehicle SJG8766R Insured Under Direct Asia Against Your Insured Vehicle 
SNG6157P acc on : 14/12/2022 15:49 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22012801/Kpa3 
  
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
Thank you for your email. 
  
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
  
Hi HT, 
  
Kindly assist. 
  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 
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Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 January 2023 9:13 AM 
To: gerald@almsm.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MeiLi Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <meili@almsm.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: 2nd Liability Check - Our Client Vehicle SJG8766R Insured Under Direct Asia Against Your Insured Vehicle 
SNG6157P acc on : 14/12/2022 15:49 
  
Dear Gerald, 
  
Thank you for the email. 
  
  
Dear Admin-A, 
  
Kindly assist. Thank you. 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: gerald@almsm.com.sg <gerald@almsm.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 6:40 PM 
To: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MeiLi Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <meili@almsm.com.sg> 
Subject: 2nd Liability Check - Our Client Vehicle SJG8766R Insured Under Direct Asia Against Your Insured Vehicle 
SNG6157P acc on : 14/12/2022 15:49 
  
Dear Motor Claim Team, 
  
Kindly assist to advise back on the liability. 
   
Best Regards, 
 
Gerald - (Sin Ming) 
176 Sin Ming Drive 
#05-12 Sin Ming Autocare 
Singapore 575721 
Tel: 6456 3637 Fax: 6456 3686 
  
  

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 23 December 2022 8:10 pm 
To: admin-a@lkkauto.com; Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: gerald@almsm.com.sg 
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Subject: FW: Liability Check - Our Client Vehicle SJG8766R Insured Under Direct Asia Against Your Insured Vehicle 
SNG6157P acc on : 14/12/2022 15:49 
  

Internal 

  
Dear LKK  
  
Kindly assist 
  

From: gerald@almsm.com.sg <gerald@almsm.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, December 23, 2022 12:35 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <CLAIMS@ALLIANZ.COM.SG> 
Cc: MeiLi Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <meili@almsm.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] Liability Check - Our Client Vehicle SJG8766R Insured Under Direct Asia Against Your Insured Vehicle 
SNG6157P acc on : 14/12/2022 15:49 
  
Dear Motor Claim Team, 
  
Kindly refer to the mark estimate by LKK surveyor Mr Kenneth and assist to advise back on the liability. 
   
Best Regards, 
 
Gerald - (Sin Ming) 
176 Sin Ming Drive 
#05-12 Sin Ming Autocare 
Singapore 575721 
Tel: 6456 3637 Fax: 6456 3686 
  
  

From: gerald@almsm.com.sg <gerald@almsm.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 21 December 2022 5:02 pm 
To: 'CLAIMS@ALLIANZ.COM.SG' <CLAIMS@ALLIANZ.COM.SG> 
Cc: MeiLi Tan - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming (meili@almsm.com.sg) <meili@almsm.com.sg> 
Subject: Request To Register TP claim - Our Client Vehicle SJG8766R Insured Under Direct Asia Against Your Insured 
Vehicle SNG6157P acc on : 14/12/2022 15:49 
  
Dear Motor Claim Team, 
  
We refer to the attachment.  
  
Kindly assist to register our client’s TP claim & arrange for a survey on 23/12/2022. 
   
Best Regards, 
 
Gerald - (Sin Ming) 
176 Sin Ming Drive 
#05-12 Sin Ming Autocare 
Singapore 575721 
Tel: 6456 3637 Fax: 6456 3686 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 1:51 PM
To: richardgoh1861@gmail.com
Subject: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNG6157P AND SJG8766R 

AT/ALONG NEAR 4 PAYA LEBAR WAY OPPOSITE MACPHERSON cc OPEN CARPARK 
ON 14/12/2022

GOH BOO CHIN                               [By Email Only] 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SNG6157P 
Our Ref: CC4/AIS22012801/Kpa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNG6157P AND SJG8766R AT/ALONG NEAR 4 PAYA LEBAR WAY OPPOSITE MACPHERSON 
cc OPEN CARPARK ON 14/12/2022 
  
We refer to the above subject matter.  We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SJG8766R against your insurance policy. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. Therefore, 
we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid further litigation, 
which would escalate to even more cost.  
  
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy. 
  
As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights 
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third 
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the 
date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and acknowledged by Allianz. 
  
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and 
consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this 
accident, please forward it to us immediately. You may email it to customerservice@allianz.com.sg or deliver it by 
hand to Allianz Customer Care Centre. 
  
This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach 
of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed. 
  
In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final 
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).  
  
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 6742 3197 or chewht@lkkauto.com. 
  
Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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