Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 July 2023 12:42 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SNC 448K FINALISE

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Workshop agree as below, assighnment pg and estimate uploaded in Views.

Regards
Taufikh

From: Tsl Auto <tslautogarage@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, July 6, 2023 11:42 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SNC 448K FINALISE

We comfirm at $7000 lump sum 6 days working days
Thanks regards

On Wed, 5 Jul 2023 at 10:23 PM, Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Sir,

COR I/s $7000, 6 days.

Subject to insurance approval.

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto



