Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, December 21, 2022 4:36 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Ninja; Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: TP DS claim: Accident involving SME2343S and SNC9832A on 27/11/2022 at NEX

MALL 1A CARPARK

Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti,
Thank you for the assignment.
Dear Ninja,

Appointment confirmed.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 21 December 2022 3:52 PM

To: Ninja <ninja@bhauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: admin-d <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: TP DS claim: Accident involving SME2343S and SNC9832A on 27/11/2022 at NEX MALL 1A CARPARK

Internal

Your ref: SME2343S

Our ref: 2022 22008493FR-SNC9832A

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey)

File: SNC9832A Ol.pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=7005192d-dedf-40bc-911f-73b97f0d5e3a-fbd0b182f37912cc
Size: ~ 0 MByte, Download available until: 12/26/2022




Passwords will be sent in a separate email.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQ | Allianz @) |

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Ninja <ninja@bhauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, December 21, 2022 11:11 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: BHAS - Eric Cheong <eric@bhauto.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Accident involving SME2343S and SNC9832A on 27/11/2022 at NEX MALL 1A CARPARK

Your Vehicle: SNC9832A WITHOUT PREJUDICE

3RP Party Vehicle: SME2343S

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We would like to arrange survey of the above mentioned accident vehicle.

Please refer to file attached on the copy of Accident Report and Accident photos for the assessment of
liability; liability check.

Appreciate awaiting for your favourable reply asap. Please kindly assist.
Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at:

BH Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 1 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-111 to 117 Singapore 575636



P/S: Vehicle will be in the workshop on 23/12/2022 @ 11AM

CUSTOMER WILL BE WAITING
Greatly appreciate it. Thank you and have a nice day

Best Regards,

Ninja Lo
Claim Department

» BH AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

BLE 1 SiN MING INMDUSTRIAL FSTATE SECTOR C #OI-191/90 10418017
EIHNOGAPORE 575836 TEL: (B5) 8550 BG44 FAX (B5) 6260 F404

I - I CO. REG,. NO.: 20080075 12K GET REG. NO.: 2000175 12K

(W) +65 6559 8945 (F) +65 6269 2404 (HP) +65 8282 2011
(E)ninja@bhauto.com.sg  http://www.bhauto.com.sg
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This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the addressee named. If you are not the named
addressee (or authorised to receive for the addressee) you must not disseminate, distribute or copy this email. Please
notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your
system.



