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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: enquiry@sh-motor.com
Sent: Friday, 23 June 2023 12:24 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: vehicle no : SNA3717A-Final 1-2

Dear Shiau Chan, 
 
Accept cost of repair of Lump Sum $8,500.00 before excess $250.00 & GST. 
 
 
Thanks & Best Regards, 
  
You Qing 
S&H MOTOR PTE LTD 
160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02  
Sin Ming AutoCity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931 

 
 
 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2023 5:37 PM 
To: doris@sh-motor.com 
Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: vehicle no : SNA3717A-Final 1-2 
 
Dear Doris, 
 
Any updates? 
 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, June 7, 2023 11:45 AM 
To: doris@sh-motor.com 
Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: vehicle no : SNA3717A-Final 1-2 
 
Dear Doris, 
 
Any updates? 
 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, June 5, 2023 4:56 PM 
To: doris@sh-motor.com 
Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: vehicle no : SNA3717A-Final 1-2 
 
Dear Doris, 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump Sum $8,500.00 before excess $250.00 & GST  and 6 days of 
repair, subject to their approval. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: doris@sh-motor.com <doris@sh-motor.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, May 24, 2023 11:46 AM 
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: vehicle no : SNA3717A-Final 1-2 
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From: doris@sh-motor.com <doris@sh-motor.com>  
Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 5:29 PM 
To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: vehicle no : SNA3717A-Final 1-2 
 
Kenneth 
 
Forward for you record. 
 
Thank 
 
Doris 
 

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 5:12 PM 
To: Doris <doris@sh-motor.com> 
Subject: RE: vehicle no : SNA3717A-Final 1-2 
 
Where is the after paint photos?? 
 

From: Doris <doris@sh-motor.com>  
Sent: Friday, March 10, 2023 2:22 PM 
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: vehicle no : SNA3717A-Final 1-2 
 
 
 

From: Doris [mailto:doris@sh-motor.com]  
Sent: Friday, 20 January 2023 12:19 PM 
To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' 
Subject: vehicle no : SNA3717A-Final 
 
Dear Kenneth 
 
Forward vehicle no : SNA 3717 A for final lump sum repair 
 
Thank 
 
Doris 


