Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

From: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@premierauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, May 8, 2023 9:06 AM

To: Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

Cc: Angela Tan; Lim Jia Haw

Subject: RE: Finalization request_SML7704P_OD CLAIM PART BY PART _DOA : 20.12.2022

Dear Xin Yu,
We accept your offer

thanks

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 8 May 2023 9:01 AM

To: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@premierauto.com.sg>

Cc: Angela Tan <angela.tan@premierauto.com.sg>; Lim Jia Haw <jiahaw.lim@premierauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Finalization request_SML7704P_0OD CLAIM PART BY PART _DOA : 20.12.2022

Dear Chee Kwong,
Without prejudice

We have re-check the cost of repair, we will be advising our Principal the cost of repair of $5,819.10/- before Excess $2,000
& GST with 5 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly check and confirm. Thank you.

Best Regards,

Xin Yu | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315 | email: xinyu@lkkauto.com / sur@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@premierauto.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, May 6, 2023 10:58 AM

To: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Angela Tan <angela.tan@premierauto.com.sg>; Lim Jia Haw <jiahaw.lim@premierauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Finalization request_SML7704P_0OD CLAIM PART BY PART _DOA :20.12.2022

Dear Xin Yu,
Our calculations is,
Parts $4231 + 10% = $4654.1

Nett item S75
Labour $1090 + Parts $4654.1 + Nett S75 = Total amount $5819.1

Please kindly help double check n thanks

Best Regards,
Chee Kwong



Motor Claims advisor
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Branch: Carros)

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 May 2023 5:23 PM

To: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@premierauto.com.sg>

Cc: Angela Tan <angela.tan@premierauto.com.sg>; Lim Jia Haw <jiahaw.lim@premierauto.com.sg>
Subject: FW: Finalization request_SML7704P_OD CLAIM PART BY PART _DOA : 20.12.2022

Dear Chee Kwong,
“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $5,691.50/- before Excess $2,000 & GST with 5 days of repair, subject to
their approval.

Best Regards,

Xin Yu | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315 | email: xinyu@lkkauto.com / sur@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, February 25, 2023 8:52 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Finalization request_SML7704P_OD CLAIM PART BY PART _DOA : 20.12.2022

From: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@premierauto.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 25 February 2023 8:51:34 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Angela Tan <angela.tan@premierauto.com.sg>; Lim Jia Haw <jiahaw.lim@premierauto.com.sg>
Subject: Finalization request_SML7704P_OD CLAIM PART BY PART _DOA : 20.12.2022

Dear Taufikh,
Finalization request_SML7704P_OD CLAIM PART BY PART _DOA :20.12.2022

Please kindly refer before paint photos and supplier’s invoices for finalize.

Best Regards,

Chee Kwong

Motor Claims advisor

Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Branch: Carros)

Address: 60 Jalan Lam Huat Carros Centre, #07-43 Singapore 737869

Tel: 6255 2288 | MOBILE: 9644 6630 | Fax: 6265 5388

Premier Taxis Pte Ltd | Premier Rent A Car Pte Ltd | Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd | Premier Land (East) Pte Ltd |
Premier Realty Pte Ltd



Visit us at: www.premier-rentacar.com | www.premiertaxi.com.sg




