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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 19 December 2022 2:08 PM
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A; Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi (Strides 

Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Tay Boon Chew (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Yeo 
Poh Suan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Grace Ng Siu Ching (Strides 
Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Lim Wei Siong (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Goh 
Kok Khoon (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)

Cc: assignments
Subject: RE: AIS REF: TBC/KC - SLV937P - RE: SHB5887U - SURVEY (ALLIANZ) 

Categories: HMK

Dear Janice, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, 17 December 2022 1:10 PM 
To: Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Thaiyal.Nayagi@strides.com.sg>; Tay Boon Chew 
(Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <BoonChew.Tay@strides.com.sg>; Yeo Poh Suan (Strides Automotive Services Pte 
Ltd) <PohSuan.Yeo@strides.com.sg>; Grace Ng Siu Ching (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) 
<SiuChing.Ng@strides.com.sg>; Lim Wei Siong (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <WeiSiong.Lim@strides.com.sg>; 
Goh Kok Khoon (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <KokKhoon.Goh@strides.com.sg> 
Cc: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: AIS REF: TBC/KC - SLV937P - RE: SHB5887U - SURVEY (ALLIANZ)  
 

Internal 

 
 
Your ref: SHB5887U 
Our ref: TBC/KC - SLV937P 
  
Dear Sirs,  
  
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey. 
  
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.  
   
Thank you. 
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Janice Koh 
Claims Specialist 
Claims & Performance Management 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 
www.allianz.sg  
 

 

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the 
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
 

From: Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Thaiyal.Nayagi@strides.com.sg>  
Sent: 17 December, 2022 08:42 AM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Tay Boon Chew (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <BoonChew.Tay@strides.com.sg>; Yeo Poh Suan (Strides 
Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <PohSuan.Yeo@strides.com.sg>; Grace Ng Siu Ching (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) 
<SiuChing.Ng@strides.com.sg>; Lim Wei Siong (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <WeiSiong.Lim@strides.com.sg>; 
Goh Kok Khoon (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <KokKhoon.Goh@strides.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] RE: SHB5887U - SURVEY (ALLIANZ)  
 
Dear Sir /Mdm, 
 
Kindly arrange to survey SHB5887U within 48 hours according to GIA guidelines, involving your insured 
SLV937P. 
 
 
Vehicle in  SMRT Woodlands Depot 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
“Be Kind. Be present. Compliment people. Magnify their strengths, not their weaknesses. This is how to make a difference.” 
 
Thank you & Regards 
Shanti 
Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
DID 68662671/2 
Thaiyal.Nayagi@strides.com.sg 
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