Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 January 2023 2:51 PM

To: Vivian Tan

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Finalize For SMP7992C (DOA 16/12/2022) - TP (SPF)
Hi Vivian,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $2,706.56./- with 03 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Earth- FPrint only when necessary-

From: Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 3:18 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalize For SMP7992C (DOA 16/12/2022) - TP (SPF)
Without Prejudice

Dear Mr. Rasul,

Finalise COR @ P/P S$2,706.56 (before GST)

03 working days

Attach the adjustment Estimate for your reference.

Please check & revert for confirmation.

Thank you & warmest regards

Regards,

Vivian Tan

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
|

Tel : 6513 7748 | Fax : 6251 3161
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800
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