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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>
Sent: Monday, 19 December 2022 11:20 AM
To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto); assignments; SUR
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: Paper re-survey on WC2018Z  //   Accident involving WC 2018 Z and XE 329 S 

on 28/09/2022     //   Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/026354

Lonpac External - General 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE SAVE AS TO COST 
 
Hi Meng Yan, 
 
TP survey report and colour photos can be found in the following link: 
 
Please download Part 2 via this link:- https://drive.google.com/file/d/1CCK6mZmHt-PsRQI6N4596-
6E0GNls559/view?usp=sharing 
 
Thanks 
 
 
Huey Ni 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 19 December 2022 10:56 am 
To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Paper re-survey on WC2018Z // Accident involving WC 2018 Z and XE 329 S on 28/09/2022 // Our Ref: 
22/22/22/VC05/026354 
 
Dear Huey Ni, 
 
Noted with thanks. 
 
Kindly provide TP SR and colour photograph. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Saturday, 17 December 2022 4:23 PM 
To: Report <report@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Paper re-survey on WC2018Z // Accident involving WC 2018 Z and XE 329 S on 28/09/2022 // Our Ref: 
22/22/22/VC05/026354 
 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Hi Team LKK, 
 
Please do a paper re-survey and let us have your report in three weeks’ time. 
 
Thank you.  
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eng Huey Ni 
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9244 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: ENG HUEY NI  
Sent: Saturday, 17 December 2022 4:20 pm 
To: jin@tcmg.com.sg 
Cc: lhling@tcmg.com.sg; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Accident involving WC 2018 Z and XE 329 S on 28/09/2022 | YOUR REF: LLH/rl/1327/1122/SWM // Our Ref: 
22/22/22/VC05/026354 
 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Without Prejudice Save as to Costs 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm 
 
We acknowledge receipt of your letter dated 5.12.2022 
 
We are investigating your client’s claim and will reply to you substantively soon. 
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Best Regards 
 
Eng Huey Ni 
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9244 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: jin@tcmg.com.sg <jin@tcmg.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 5 December 2022 10:51 am 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Ling Leong Hui <lhling@tcmg.com.sg>; Gerald <gerald@tcmg.com.sg> 
Subject: Accident involving WC 2018 Z and XE 329 S on 28/09/2022 | OUR REF: LLH/rl/1327/1122/SWM YOUR REF: 
XE 329 S 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We enclose herewith a copy of our letter dated 5 December 2022 with enclosure for your attention. 
 
Please download Part 2 via this link:- https://drive.google.com/file/d/1CCK6mZmHt-PsRQI6N4596-
6E0GNls559/view?usp=sharing 
 
 
 
Regards, 
Rachel Ling on behalf of Mr. Ling Leong Hui 
 
TOMMY CHOO MARK GO LLC 
51 Chin Swee Road #03-91 
Singapore 160051 
Tel: 6532 2455 
Fax: 6538 9850 
 


