Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 December 2022 5:32 PM

To: ‘Lim, Sharon (Allianz Insurance Singapore)’; SUR

Subject: RE: CHECKING ON MARKET VALUE SKQ4727R DOA 29/11/2022 OUR REF

C88AISCL2022-0017

Dear Sharon,

The MV of SKQ 4727R is $37K-$40K(est) as at Nov 2022.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 December 2022 11:16 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: CHECKING ON MARKET VALUE SKQ4727R DOA 29/11/2022 OUR REF C88AISCL2022-0017

Hi Sur,

FYNA. Thanks.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lim, Sharon (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <sharon.lim@allianz.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 15 December 2022 11:06 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; edna.lee@a-pac.sg; patrick.soo@a-pac.sg
Subject: CHECKING ON MARKET VALUE SKQ4727R DOA 29/11/2022 OUR REF C88AISCL2022-0017

Internal

Dear all

Please assist to check for the market value for the above/attached vehicle at day of accident and update us
accordingly.

Thank you.

Sharon Lim
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