Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@Ilonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 16 December 2022 5:14 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Meng Yan (LKK Auto); GERALD POH WEE BIN; SUR;
MT_Claim_SG

Cc: assignments

Subject: OD Authorization (SKX1568R); D.O.A. 10/12/2022 // Lonpac Ref:
22/22/22/VP05/026693

Lonpac External - General

Hi Veron,

Please proceed to authorise OD repair at $25,312.95 (including check items
$5,863.95) before excess and before GST. Check items to be verified and confirmed.

Excess is $600.00

Please attempt lump sum as insured vehicle is old and the part-by-part repair cost
recommended is very close to the nett value of the vehicle.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Eng Huey Ni

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9244 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 16 December 2022 8:38 am

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: To arrange survey for our vehicle no : SKX1568R claiming Own Damge D.0.A. 10/12/2022

Dear Gerald,



Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKX 1568R
Date of survey: 15/12/2022
Number of days (estimated) : 9 days

Lump Sum Repair
We have Not authorise repair.

Kindly let us have your approval please.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 December 2022 2:54 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: To arrange survey for our vehicle no : SKX1568R claiming Own Damge D.0.A. 10/12/2022

Dear Gerald,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 December 2022 2:20 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: To arrange survey for our vehicle no : SKX1568R claiming Own Damge D.O.A. 10/12/2022

Lonpac External - General

Our Ref 1 22/22/22/VP05/026693 ( Huey Ni’s case)
Dear Meng Yan,

FYNA. Excess under Section I is $600.00.



Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 December 2022 2:11 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ionpac.com>

Subject: To arrange survey for our vehicle no : SKX1568R claiming Own Damge D.O.A. 10/12/2022

Dear Sir/Madam,

We attach estimated cost of repair for your kind consideration.
Vehicle is IN our workshop and pls arrange survey.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931



