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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 15 December 2022 10:04 AM
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A; assignments
Subject: RE: AIS REF: TBC/FR- GBF11M - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH1233D , GBF11M & 

SLG4319B ALONG NICOLL HIGHWAY TOWARDS CITY ON 11.12.2022 / 2240

Categories: HMK

Dear Janice, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 14 December 2022 10:08 PM 
To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: AIS REF: TBC/FR- GBF11M - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH1233D , GBF11M & SLG4319B ALONG NICOLL HIGHWAY 
TOWARDS CITY ON 11.12.2022 / 2240 
 

Internal 

 
 
Dear Survey Firm, 
 
OI NON REPORT 
 
Please retrieved documents via Allianz FileXchange link below and create claim in Merimen accordingly. 
 
File: 20221214 - TP GIA & LTA DOC.msg, SLH1233D TP GIA.pdf, LTA.pdf,... 
Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=4a1af095-d989-490d-95a3-205e51283206-
1acc6c5eeda5da78 
Size: ~ 0 MByte, Download available until: 12/28/2022 
 
 
Password: Allianz1 
 
Thank you  
 
Janice Koh 
Claims Specialist 
Claims & Performance Management 
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Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 
www.allianz.sg  
 

 

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the 
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)  
Sent: 14 December, 2022 10:06 PM 
To: 'Xin Hua' <xinhuaworkshop1@gmail.com> 
Cc: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: AIS REF: TBC/FR- GBF11M - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH1233D , GBF11M & SLG4319B ALONG NICOLL HIGHWAY 
TOWARDS CITY ON 11.12.2022 / 2240 
 
 
 
Your ref: SLH1233D 
Our ref: TBC/FR- GBF11M 
  
Dear Sirs,  
  
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey. 
  
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.  
   
Thank you. 
  
Janice Koh 
Claims Specialist 
Claims & Performance Management 
 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 
www.allianz.sg  
 

 

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the 
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 

From: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshop1@gmail.com>  
Sent: 14 December, 2022 08:51 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] Re: AIS REF: TBC/FR- GBF11M - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH1233D , GBF11M & SLG4319B ALONG NICOLL 
HIGHWAY TOWARDS CITY ON 11.12.2022 / 2240 
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Dear Janice, 
 
We would like to appoint LKK to conduct the pre repair inspection. 
 
Thank You. 
 
 
Regards, 
Allan 
87867171 
 
On Wed, 14 Dec 2022 at 17:58, Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote: 

Internal 

 

  

Your Ref: SLH1233D 

Our Ref : TBC/FR- GBF11M 

  

  

Dear Sirs 

  

Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):- 

  

 AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 
 A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd 
 Form Team  Consultancy  Pte Ltd 
 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd    

  

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list. 

  

Best regards, 

  

Janice Koh 

Claims Specialist 
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Claims & Performance Management 

  

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 

79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 

www.allianz.sg  

  

 

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the 
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

  

  

  

From: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshop1@gmail.com>  
Sent: 14 December, 2022 10:46 AM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] Fwd: AIS REF: TBC/FR- GBF11M - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH1233D , GBF11M & SLG4319B ALONG NICOLL 
HIGHWAY TOWARDS CITY ON 11.12.2022 / 2240 

  

Dear Janice, 

  

Please refer to the GIA and the LTA search , kindly send out the list of surveyors to conduct the pre repair inspection. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Regards, 

Allan 
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87867171 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Date: Tue, 13 Dec 2022 at 16:39 
Subject: AIS REF: TBC/FR- GBF11M - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH1233D , GBF11M & SLG4319B ALONG NICOLL HIGHWAY 
TOWARDS CITY ON 11.12.2022 / 2240 
To: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshop1@gmail.com> 
Cc: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshop@gmail.com> 

  

Internal 

  

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sir/Madam 

  

Kindly  provide us your client GIA report and LTA search fee.  

  

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department 
at claims@allianz.com.sg 

  

Thank you. 

  

Janice Koh 

Claims Specialist 

Claims & Performance Management 

  

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 

79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 

www.allianz.sg  
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Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the 
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

  

From: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshop1@gmail.com>  
Sent: 12 December, 2022 07:01 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshop@gmail.com> 
Subject: [EXT] ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH1233D , GBF11M & SLG4319B ALONG NICOLL HIGHWAY TOWARDS CITY ON 
11.12.2022 / 2240 

  

To the officer in charge, 

 We are appointed workshop bearing the car plates SLH1233D ,accident happened due to the collision by your insured GBF11M   . 

 Kindly help to arrange PRI at the following address: 

  

XINHUA WORKSHOP PTE LTD 

No 23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 

#04-01 

S(415933) 

  

--“Without Prejudice” 

 
 

 Dear  
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--  

“Without Prejudice” 

 
 
 
--  
“Without Prejudice” 


