Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 December 2022 6:29 PM

To: Precise Auto Service

Cc: admin-d; assignments

Subject: AIS REF: ABRAISCL2022-00012KC-SMM5809D - Pre-repair Inspection For (SJR

4561H). Your Insured Vehicle No: (SMM 5809D)

Internal

Your ref: SJR4561H
Our ref: ABRAISCL2022-00012KC-SMM5809D

Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Thank you.

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQP | Allianz @ | (.

Warldwides Olymplc ond Porolymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg>

Sent: 13 December, 2022 03:01 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Re: Pre-repair Inspection For (SJR 4561H). Your Insured Vehicle No: (SMM 5809D)
Dear Janice,

As your requested, hereto attached our client's GIA report.

Thanks & Regards

Arine

On Tue, 13 Dec 2022 at 11:50, Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote:

Internal
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Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

Kindly provide us your client GIA report.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department
at claims@allianz.com.sg

Thank you.

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C

79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQ | Alianz @ | (.o

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralymplc Postner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg>

Sent: 12 December, 2022 04:29 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Pre-repair Inspection For (SJR 4561H). Your Insured Vehicle No: (SMM 5809D)
2




Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the matter mentioned above, herewith enclosed 2 days' notice & LTA Search Results for your attention.
Kindly arrange a date and time to do a PRI for our client's vehicle (SJR 4561H) in our workshop ASAP.

Thank You

Best Regards

Arine

T:67457367 | F:6841 3390

E : support@preciseauto.sg

W: www.preciseauto.sg

A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883

Follow us on social media:

ttps://www.instagram.com/preciseautosvs/




ttps://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/
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